TUSCALOOSA COUNTY COMMISSION
MEETING
September 4, 2002

TUSCALOOSA COUNTY §
STATE OF ALABAMA

This being the date and hour to which the Tuscaloosa County
Commission adjourned, the County Commission met pursuant to such
adjournment with Probate Judge W. Hardy McCollum presiding as

Chairman. The following members were present:

Mike Richardson
Gary Youngblood
Bobby Miller

Reginald Murray

Commissioner Gary Youngblood moved, seconded by Commissioner
Bobby Miller, the County Commission voted unanimously to waive
the fifty foot right-of-way requirement for a section of Medders

Road to facilitate improvement of said road.

Commissioner Reginald Murray moved, seconded by Commissioner
Gary Youngblood, the County Commission voted unanimously to award
the bid for earthwork and related construction on Hulsey Road
and Bristol Drive to Tomlin Construction LLC. The Engineering
Department elected to deduct Alternate 1 and Item 401A-001 for
a net bid of $88,622.94. The bids were opened August 28, 2002.

Commissioner Reginald Murray moved, seconded by Commissioner
Gary Youngblood, the County Commission voted unanimously to award
the bid for water relocation on Hulsey Road and Bristol Drive

to Fairchild Construction. The bids were opened August 28, 2002.
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Commissioner Reginald Murray moved, seconded by Commissioner
Bobby Miller, the County Commission voted unanimously to authorize
County Attorney Robert Spence to proceed with legal action against
AT&T to have AT&T lines moved on Hulsey Road to facilitate improving
said road.

Commissioner Bobby Miller moved, seconded by Commissioner
Gary Youngblood, the County Commission voted unanimously to autho-
rize condemnation, if necessary, in order to acquire the necessary

rights-of-way on Myers Road to facilitate improving said road.

Bids on the following items were opened and referred to the
County Engineer for appropriate action:

HOT & COLD LAID ASPHALT PLANT MIX
APAC~Alabama, Inc.

S.T. Bunn Construction Co., Inc.
West Alabama Asphalt, Inc.

Exhibit 9-1, Pages [§5-197

TRAFFIC STRIPING
Ozark Striping Co., Inc.
J.C. Cheek Sod & Erosion Contractor, Inc.

Exhibit 9-2, Pages [93- 200

CRUSHED STONE
Martin Marietta Aggregates

Exhibit 9-3, Pages 30[- 202

LIQUID ASPHALT CEMENT AND LIQUID EMULSIFIED ASPHALT
Hunt Refining Company
Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.

Exhibit 9-4, Pages 203-205

HYDROSEEDING
Whittemore Farms

Exhibit 9-5, Pages X0b- 0%

STRUCTURAL CONCRETE
West Alabama Concrete, Inc.
Bama Concrete Products Co., Inc.

Exhibit 9-6, Pages 209- &l

MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICAL
Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc.

Exhibit 9-7, Pages Ald- a13
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Commissioner Reginald Murray moved, seconded by Commissioner
Bobby Miller, the County Commission voted three to one to authorize
placing the Grant Program Manager, a non-civil service position
in the Planning and Community Development Office, under the Retire-
ment System of Alabama. Commissioner Mike Richardson cast the
NAY vote.

Commissioner Reginald Murray moved, seconded by Commissioner
Bobby Miller, the County Commission voted unanimously to lower
the speed limit on Sipsey Valley Road in the area of Buhl Church
of God and near the Pate Road intersection to 35 MPH.

There being no further business to come before the Tuscaloosa

County Commission, the meeting adjourned to Wednesday, September 11,

Hd%dy McColl\dm
Judge of Probate and Chairman
Tuscaloosa County Commission

Mike Richardson
Commissioner - District I

Gary Young
;5 Commissioner - District II
9

\v 1
o é; ¢ é?ﬁ %//1{.
Bobby Mi¥ler v oY
Commissioner - District III

P N

Reginalfd Murray
Commissioner - District IV




W. Harny MoColem MEMBLRS
CHAIRMAN Mixe Rictiaroson
GARY YOUNGBLOOD
Rosert F. JoHNsTON Bopey MILLER
CLERK ReGinaLD MURRAY
CouNTtYy COMMISSION [
TuscaLoosa COUNTY ALABAMA o
P.O. Box 20113 = 714 GREENSBORO AVENUE AUG 2
TUSCALOOSA, ALABAMA 35402-0113 RS
205-349-3870
August 22, 2002
West Alabama Asphalt Mallory Burkhalter Paving, Inc.
APAC Alabama, Inc. S.T. Bunn Construction Co.
A.C, Jackson & Son Mac Nelson Construction
Stripes
Gentlemen:

Tuscaloosa County will accept bids for "Hot and Cold Laid Asphalt Plant
Mix" until 9:00 a.m., Wednesday, September 4, 2002 . This material
will be provided for the period from October 1, 2002, through

September 30, 2003.

The attached specifications and bid sheets were compiled by the County
Engineering Department. Direct all inquiries in regard to this bid

to County Engineer Bobby Hagler at telephone number (205)345-6600.
Bids can be mailed to: Tuscaloosa County Commission, P.0. Box 20113,
Tuscaloosa, AL 35402, or brought to the County Clerk's Office in the

Tuscaloosa County Courthouse prior to 9:00 a.m., Wednesday,
September 4, 2002.

To be more confident that your bid will be properly processed, please
return your bid in the "BID" envelope provided, or use the "BID"
envelope to address your bid package.

A word to the wise - MAIL EARLY - overnight mail, including Airborne
Express, Federal Express, etc. does not always arrive by 9:00 a.m.
the next day.

Sincerely,

7
Robert/H.

Johnston
Clerk

RHJ :1ks
encl.

Copy: %g%ineering
lie

£ 9



F.0.B. ANY DESTINATION IN COUNTY PER TON 19

BY VENDORS TRUCKS
NORTH OF BLACK WARRIOR RIVER

ITEM/DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT PRICE BID AMOUNT
(TONS) (PER TON)
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Wearing 27,000
Surface), 2" Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range Y2
C 3R2°7 | 977 50.°°
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Patching), 2" LS50 0
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C i 35. 5 522 5, o0
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Leveling), ¥4” 36,000 50
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C 33, | 172 o00, o0 |
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Widening), 2" 1,000 ’
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C 75,52 F5500.°%
ttumi te Asphalt Mix 1,4 5,000
416A Bituminous Concrete Asp X 32, 50 A oo |

roraL 23, 250 {25, o0

P.0.Box 818
Birmingham, AL 3520}

APAC-Alabama, Inc.
COMPANY

W. S. waﬂ(ins' vV ]

SIGNATURE

oz
DATE /



F.0.B. VENDOR'S PLANT °e
NORTH OF BLACK WARRIOR RIVER
ITEM/DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT PRICE BID AMOUNT
(TONS) (PER TON)

479A Bituminous Concrete Asphait (Wearing 250

rface), 4" Maxim i SAL Ran .
E:u e), 2 um A_ggreg_ate Size, E ge o B' A—
479A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Patching), 12" 50
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C . v
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Leveling), 2" 50
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C v
429 A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Widening), 23 S0 —
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C
416A Biturninous Concrete Asphalt Mix 1,4 50 e

TOTAL No Egi

APAC-Alabama, Inc.:

PO. Box 818

Birmingham, AL 35201
COMPANY

SIGNATURE

/2 /oA
DATE
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F.O.B. ANY DESTINATION IN COUNTY PER TON
BY YENDORS TRUCKS
SOUTH OF BLACK WARRIOR RIVER

ITEM/DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT PRICE BID AMOUNT

(TONS) | (PER TON)

429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Weanng 21,000

Surface), %" Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range

c__- .| 32.%5° |98 5007

429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Patching), /2" 50

Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C 35, 56 533 5 1 dd

429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Leveling), /2" 27,000

Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Rauge C 23 50| £77520.%°

429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Widening), 2" 550 50

Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C 35, [ 535, Z4

416A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt Mix 1,4 5,000 225, 50 l L op |

APAC-Alabama, Inc.

P.O. Box 818
Birmingham, AL 35201

TOTAL ,f 747’, 250,00

COMPANY

Ma& W. S. Watkins V. p

SIGNATURE

£ /aelox
DATE r

e 037 184

Ex 9



F.0.B. VENDOR’S PLANT e
SOUTH OF BLACK WARRIOR RIVER
ITEM/DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT PRICE BID AMOUNT

(TONS) (PER TON)
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphait (Wearing 250
Surface), 2" Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range 5
C - 2],2 ' p &2 5 ) o D
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Patching), 2" 50 5
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C . 2o s o 1 325,272
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Leveling), /4" 50 6o
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C Ré- / 3 25, 20
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Widening), '2” 50
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C % ) 50 /1325, op
416A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt Mix 1,4 50

26,59\ 1325.%°
TOTAL

APAC-Alabama, Ine.

P.O. Box 818 -
Birmingham, AL 35201

COMPANY

o’

SIGNATURE

W._S. Watkins, V. P.

S ocloz
{ {

DATE

[l 9225,°°

x4




F.O.B. ANY DESTINATION IN COUNTY PER TON

4.9

BY VENDORS TRUCKS
NORTH OF BLACK WARRIOR RIVER
ITEM/DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT PRICE BID AMOUNT
(TONS) (PER TON)

429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Wearing 27,000
Surface), 2" Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range
C - 3h.15 | RGR,050,00 |
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Patching), '4” L50
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C i A4. 186 4, 8AA 50
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphait (Leveling), 14" 36,000
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C 25,15 [1,157,400.00
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Widening), 12" 1,000 ) )
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C 3Ah. 15 AN 0
416A Biturminous Concrete Asphalt Mix 1,4 5,000

_ 25h.15 160, 16¢,00

TOTAL %, %53, 113. 50

COMP

g

5T'/4u.m Mlé{:;.c‘vogrmc.

SIGNATURE [/ =

9-4-0
DATE‘///f

437 190

Ex 4



F.0.B. VENDOR’S PLANT °8
NORTH OF BLACK WARRIOR RIVER
ITEM/DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT PRICE BID AMOUNT

(TONS) | (PER TON)
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Wearing 250
Surface), 12" Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range
C : NU (b (W]
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Patching), 42" 50
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C . Ne B
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Leveling), %" S0
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C Ng b0
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Widening), 14" 50
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C Ne Byo
416A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt Mix 1,4 50

N 4] B 1 0

TOTAL (o B.p

ST/ Auw T, Cao.;I:Nc..
COMP,
"
%NAY}U/?[ //
ld
DATE /



F.O.B. ANY DESTINATION IN COUNTY PER TON

BY VENDORS TRUCKS
SOUTH OF BLACK WARRIOR RIVER
[TEM/DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT PRICE BID AMOUNT
(TONS) (PER TON)
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Wearing 21,000 R
Surface), 2" Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range
C - - AZ.15 La'|5, \90, 00
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Patching), 14" 50
Maximuin Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C AA NS 4,343.50
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Leveling), 14" 27,000
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C 22,15 | 363,050, 00
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Widening), 4" 550
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C 22,18 11,632 50
416A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt Mix 1,4 5,000
24,15 [160,150.0¢

TOTAL 1,306 465,00

ST/A\MUNK’ wst. o, Twe,

COMPANY

r—

SIGNATU

Q-4

DATE

037192



F.0.B. VENDOR’S PLANT e
SOUTH OF BLACK WARRIOR RIVER
ITEM/DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT PRICE BID AMOUNT
(TONS) (PER TON)
479A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Wearing 250
Surface), 4" Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range
C +5. %% LN10, 00
120A Biturmnous Concrete Asphalt (Patching), V27 50
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C . 15,28 L RAN .00
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Leveling), 2" 50
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C 256.9% VAAMY.00
420A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Widening), 12" 50
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C 19,28 12494, 90
216A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt Mix 1,4 50
¥ 1 As4.00

TOTAL 11,446, 00

/)
5717 onb . o, Inc,
COMPANY

ey [

%NAW?Z/
q-4-

DATE




F.0.B. ANY DESTINATION IN COUNTY PER TON 479

BY VENDORS TRUCKS
NORTH OF BLACK WARRIOR RIVER

ITEM/DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT PRICE BID AMOUNT
(TONS) (PER TON)

429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Wearing 27,000
Surface), 2" Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range 32.05 $  865,350,00
c L
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Patching), 14" 150 ,
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C )l 32.05 3 4,807.50
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Leveling), 12" 36,000 -
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C 32.05 $ 1,153,800.00
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Widening), 12" 1,000 | .. , _

. . 32.05 : 32,050,00
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C $ UL
416A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt Mix 1,4 5,000 32.05 $  160,250.00

TOTAL $ 2,216,257.50

WEST ALABAMA ASPHALT INC

COMPANY
W\g, W{/}/
SIGNATURE N~
09/04/02
DATE

71w by 4
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F.0.B. VENDOR’S PLANT o
NORTH OF BLACK WARRIOR RIVER
[TEM/DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT PRICE BID AMOUNT
(TONS) | (PER TON)
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphait (Wearing 250
Surface), 2" Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range 30.05 $ 7,512.50
C
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Patching), 14" 50
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C . 2005 $ 1,502.50
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Leveling), %" 50 _
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C 30.05 $1,502.50
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Widening), 12" 50| 40,05 $ 1.502.%0
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C ' T
416A Biturunous Concrete Asphalt Mix 1,4 50 30.05 $ 1,502.50
TOTAL $ 13,522.50

WEST ALABAMA ASPHALT INC

COMPANY

SIGNATURE

09/04/02

DATE

1]



F.O.B. ANY DESTINATION IN COUNTY PER TON

6.9

BY VENDORS TRUCKS
SOUTH OF BLACK WARRIOR RIVER
ITEM/DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT PRICE BID AMOUNT
(TONS) (PER TON)
429A Bitummnous Concrete Asphalt (Wearing 21,000
Surface), 2" Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range 33.00 $ 693,000.00
C ‘ -
42915‘; Bituminous Conc'rete Asphalt (Patching), V4" I50 | 44 g9 $ 4,950.00
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C
429A Bituminous Conc.rete Asphalt (L.eveling), 2~ 27,000 13.00 $ 891,000.00
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Widemng), 12" 550
33.00 18,150.00
Maximum Aggrepate Size, ESAL Range C 5
416A BitUIill._llOUS Concrete Asphalt Mix 1,4 5,000 33,00 $ 165,000.00
TOTAL $1,772,100.00
WEST ALABAMA ASPHALT INC
COMPANY
L (e po
SIGNATURE - s
09/04/02
DATE
- 9-1
o 03T 19
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e
F.O.B. VENDOR'S PLANT s
SOUTH OF BLACK WARRIOR RIVER
ITEM/DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT PRICE BID AMOUNT
(TONS) (PER TON)
429A Brtumuinous Concrete Asphalt (Wearing 250
Surface), 2" Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range NO BID NO BID
C
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Patching), 147 50 :
Maxunum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C . NO BID NO BID
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Leveling), '4” 50| wo BID NO BID
Maxmum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C
429A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt (Widening), 2" 50
Maximum Aggregate Size, ESAL Range C NO BLD N0 BLD
416A Bituminous Concrete Asphalt Mix 1.4 501 no BID NO BID
TOTAL NO BID

WEST ALABAMA ASPHALT INC

COMPANY

W3, [

SIGNATURE

09/04/02

DATE

91



MEMBERS
Mix i RICHARDSON

W HarDY MoCoLium

CHAIRMAN
GARY YOUNGBLOOD
Roeserr FL JornsTON Borsy MILLER
CLERK = ReGiialD MURRAY
County COMMISSION
Tuscaroosa CounTy ALABAMA
I’O. Box 20113 » 714 GREENSBORO AVENUE
TuscaLOoOsa, ALaBaMa 35402-0113
205-349-3870
August 22, 2002
Ozark Striping Co. Inc. PM Laser Striping
Earnest McCullough Cheek, Inc.
Shelby Contracting Stripes, Inc.
E-Z Liner Industries Marcato & Son, Inc.
Gent lemen:

The Tuscaloosa County Commission will accept bids for traffic striping
on various roads throughout Tuscaloosa County until 9:00 a.m.,
Wednesday, September 4, 2002.

The attached bid submission form and specifications were compiled by
the Tuscaloosa County Engineering Department. Direct all inquiries
in regard to this bid to County Engineer Bobby Hagler at telephone
number (205)345-6600.

Bids can be mailed to: Tuscaloosa County Commission, P.0. Box 20113,
Tuscaloosa, AL 35402, or brought to the County Clerk's 0ffice in the
Tuscaloosa County Courthouse prior to 9:00 a.m., Wednesday,
September 4, 2002.

To be more confident that your bid will be properly processed, please
use the "BID" envelope provided, or use the "BID" envelope to address
your bid package. Submit your bid on the bid form provided.

A word to the wise - MAIL EARLY - overnight mail, including Airborne
Express, Federal Express, etc. does not always arrive by 9:00 a.m.
the next day.

Sincerely,

Johnston

Clerk

RHJ:1lks

encl.

copy: Engineering
file

037 198
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1-

BID SUBMISSION FORM AND SPECIFICATIONS

TRAFFIC STRIPING

The bidder agrees to perform all of the work as described herein and in the specifications and/or plans, as
applicable, for the following unit prices:

QUANTITY UNIT ITEM UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
150~ MILE  Solid White, Class 1, Type A Traffic Stripe 310.00 46500.00
TO1A
150 MILE Broken Yellow Class 1, Type A, Traffic Stripe 165.00 24750.00
TO1A
400 MILE  Solid Yellow, Class 1, Type A Traffic Stripe 300.00 120000. 00
TO1A
300 MILE Broken Yellow, Class 2, Type A Traffic Stripe 540.00 162000.00
. 701A
200 MILE Solid Yellow, Class 2, Type A Traffic Stripe 1080.00 216000.00
701B
3800 LF Dotted White, Class 1, Type A Traffic Stripe .42 1596.00
701B
350 MILE Broken Temporary Traffic Stripe 300.00 105000.00
701C
350 MILE  Solid Temporary Traffic Stripe 340,00 119000. 00
703C
3300 SQFT Traffic Control Markings, Class 1, Type A 1.25 4125.00
TO3A
3300 SQFT Traffic Control Legends Class 1, Type A 1.45 4785.00
703B-002
3300 SQFT Traffic Control Markings Class 2, Type A 2.10 £930.00__
T03A
3300 SQFT Traffic Control Legends Class 2, Type A 3.10 1023000
703B
2500 SQFT Temporary Traffic Control Markings 1.15 2875.00
703D
2500 SQFT Temporary Traffic Control Legends 1.15 2875.00_
703E
7500 EACH Pavement Markers, Class A, Type 1B 3.90 2925000
705A
7500 EACH Pavement Markers, Class A, Type 2D 4.00 ~30000.00

TOSA

The above stated Unit prices shall include all labor, materials, overhead, profit, insurance, testing,
inspection charges, engineering, etc. to cover the completion of the work as required. All construction,
materials, and testing shall conform to the Alabama Department of Transportation Standard Specifications
for Highway Construction 2002 Edition.

0ZARK STRIPING COMPANY, TINC.

FIRM

AUGUST 29,2002

DATE

-



BID SUBMISSION FORM AND SPECIFICATIONS
TRAFFIC STRIPING

The bidder agrees to perform all of the work as described herein and in the specifications and/or plans, as
applicable, for the following umt prices:

QUANTITY UNIT ITEM UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
150 MILE Solid White, Class 1, Type A Traffic Strige 400.00 £0,000.00
- T01A
150 MILE Broken Yellow Class 1, Type A, Traffic Stripe 275.00 41,250,00
TO01A
400 MILE Solid Yellow, Class 1, Type A Traffic Stripe 400.00 160,000.00
TO1A
300 MILE Broken Yellow, Class 2, Type A Traffic Stripe 500.00 150,000.00
701A
200 MLLE Solid Yellow, Class 2, Type A Traffic Stripe 1,000,00 200,000.00
7018
3800 LF Dotted White, Class 1, Type A Traffic Stripe -30 1.140.00
701B
350 MILE Broken Temporary Traffic Stripe 500.00 175,000.00
701C :
350 MILE Solid Temporary Traffic Stripe 700,00 245,000.00
703C
3300 SQFT Traffic Control Markings, Class 1, Type A 1.25 5,125.00
703A
3300 SQFT Traflic Control Legends Class 1, Type A 3.00 9,900.00
703B-002
3300 SQFT  Traffic Control Markings Class 2, Type A 2.00 6,600.00
703A
3300 SQFT Traffic Control Legends Class 2, Type A 5.00 16,500.00
703B _
2500 SQFT Temporary Traffic Control Markings 1.25 3,125.00
703D
2500 SQFT Temporary Traffic Control Legends 3.00 7,500.00
T03E
7500 EACH Pavement Markers, Class A, Type 1B 5.00 37,500.00
FOSA
7500 EACH Pavement Markers, Class A, Type 2D 5.00 37,500.00
JO5A

The above stated Unit prices shall include all labor, materials, overhead, profit, insurance, testing,
inspection charges, engineering, etc. to cover the compietion of the work as required. All construction,
materials, and testing shall conform to the Alabama Department of Transportation Standard Specifications
for Highway Construction 2002 Edition.

J.C.Cheek Sod & Erosion Contractor, Inc. August 30, 2002
FIRM DATE
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W I Larby MoColLum MEMBERS
CHAIRMAN Mixe RICHARDSON
GARY YOUNGBLOOD
Ropert H JornsTton Boway MILLER

CLERK

RecinaLo MurRray

CountYy COMMISSION
Tuscarcosa COUNTY ALABAMA
IO. Box 20113 » 714 GREENSBORO AVENUE
TuscaLoosa, ALasama 35402-0113
205-349-3870
August 23, 2002

Martin Marietta Aggregates Southeast Materials Corp.
Vulcan Materials Company SRM Aggregates

Gentlemen:

Tuscaloosa County will accept bids on crushed stone until 9:00 a.m.,
Wednesday, September 4, 2002 . Attached are specifications compiled
by the Engineering Department. The sizes and approximate quantities
are listed on the bid sheet.

Bids can be mailed to: Tuscaloosa County Commission, P.O. Box 20113,
Tuscaloosa, AL 35402, or brought to the County Clerk's Office in the
Tuscaloosa County Courthouse prior to 9:00 a.m., Wednesday,

September &, 2002.

Direct all inquiries in regard to this bid to County Engineer Bobby
Hagler at telephone number (205)345-6600,

To be more confident that your bid will be properly processed, please
return your bid in the "BID" envelope provided, or use the "BID"
envelope to address your bid package. Please use the bid sheet provided.
A word to the wise - MAIL EARLY - overnight mail, including Airborne
Express, Federal Express, etc. does not always arrive by 9:00 a.m.

the next day.

Sincerely,

7;,,/4%//
Robert 4. Johnston

Clerk
RHJ; 1ks
encl.

copy: EQ%ineering
ile



ALL Bidders Must Use Qur Bid Form and Show gn Envelope 278

the Bid Number and Opening Date.

Each numbered bid must be in separate envelope with Bid
Number and Opening Date on outside of each envelope.
QOriginal of this sheet MUST accompany ALL BIDS,
MAKE COPY FOR YOUR FILES

F.0.B. ANY DESTINATION IN COUNTY PER TON BY VENDORS TRUCKS

TTEM QUANTITY UNIT PRICE BID UNIT PRICE
. (TONS) F.OB. _ AMOUNT CREDIT ON
COUNTYWIDE : FREIGHT FOR
PICKUP BY
COUNTY
AL #1-#610 20000| B 7. 33 H373 200 3.5
AL #7410 30000 H 9 ¥2 29 oo 3 a5
CL. 1 RIPRAP 500 K 38 I sésp 28
CL. 2 RIPRAP 50001 f /38 H SeFo0 4, 25
/8" 40,000 . ~
CRUSHER RUN X $9 4 ¥ 37) 200 3,43
1-1/2" 500 —
CRUSHER RUN 9q %8 B ypto 2,23
CRUSHED AGGREGATE 2.500 -
BASE, TYPE B : : ¥q, 28 ﬁj?} 200 3.2

otaL ¥ 1,13/, 230

ALL BIDDERS MUST USE OUR BID FORM AND SHOW ON ENVELOPE THE BID NUMBER AND OPENING
DATE. EACH NUMBERED BID MUST BE IN SEPARATE ENVELOPE WITH BID NUMBER AND OPENING DATE
ON QUTSIDE OF EACH ENVELOPE. ORIGINAL OF THIS SHEET MUST ACCOMPANY ALL BIDS.

MAKE COPY FOR YOUR FILES

The Bidder understands that the County reserves the right to reject any and all bids and to waive any
informatities involved in the bidding process. The quantities listed above are approximate only. There will
be no contract adjustments in the unit prices for any increase or decrease in the unit quantities. The Bidder
agrees that this bid shall be good for a period of one (1) year from the date of award.

F:ussrs\allanibids and budget info\county contracts\2002\crushed stons 2002-03

43

087 207



MEMBERS

W. Harvy McCouLum
CHAIRMAN MIxE RICHARDSON
GARY YOUNGBLOOD
RoperT H. JosinstoN Bossy MiLLER

CLERK ReGivaLp Murray
TuscarLoosa COUNTY ALABAMA
FP.O. Box 20113 « 714 (GREENSBORO AVENUE
TuscaLoosa, AtaBama 35402-0113
205-349-3870
August 23, 2002

Hunt Refining Company Warrior Asphalt Refining Corp.
Vulcan Asphalt Ergon Asphalt & Emulsion
Gentlemen:

Tuscaloosa County will accept bids for '"Liquid Asphalt Cement and
Liquid Emulsified Asphalt" to be provided for the period from October 1,
2002, through September 30, 2003, until 9:00 a.m., Wednesday,

September 4, 2002

Enclosed are specificatiéns compiled by the Tuscaloosa County Engineering
Department. Direct all inquiries in regard to this bid to County
Engineer Bobby Hagler at telephone number (205)345-6600.

Bids can be mailed to: Tuscaloosa County Commission, P.0O. Box 20113,
Tuscaloosa, AL 35402, or brought to the County Clerk's Office in the
Tuscaloosa County Courthouse prior to 9:00 a.m., Wednesday,

September 4, 2002.

To be more confident that your bid will be properly processed, please
return your bid in the "BID" envelope provided, or use the "BID"
envelope to address your bid package. Use the bid sheet provided.

A word to the wise - MAIL EARLY - overnight mail, including Airborne
Express, Federal Express, etc., does not always arrive by 9:00 a.m.
the next day.

Sincerely,

Robert H. Johnston

Clerk
RHJ:1ks
encl.

COpYy: %g%ineering
lle

1-4
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F.O.B. ANY DESTINATION IN COUNTY PER TON BY VENDOR’S TRUCKS

ITEM QUANTITY UNIT PRICE
(TONS) F.0.B. COUNTYWIDE

AC-5 THROUGH 50
AC-30 $ 172.00
MC-70 THROUGH 30
MC-3000 . $ 252.00
RC-70 THROUGH 30
RC-3000 $ 257.00
RS-2 30 i

NO BID
CRS-2 30

$ 152.00
CRS-2H 50

$ 152.00
CRS-2P 500

$ 197.00
MP 30

NO BI1D
MP-1 30

NO BID
EMULSIFIED PETROLEUM | 50
RESIN NO BID

F.O.B. YENDOR’S PLANT
ITEM QUANTITY UNIT PRICE
(TONS) F.0.B. VENDOR'S PLANT

AC-5 THROUGH 30
AC-30 $ 160.00
MC-70 THROUGH 30
MC-3000 $ 240.00
RC-70 THROUGH 30
RC-3000 $ 245.00
RS-2 30

NO BID
CRS-2 30

$ 140.00
CRS-2H 30

$ 140.00
CRS-2P 3.000

$ 185.00
MP 30

NO BID
MP-1 30

NO BI1D

HUNT REFINING COMPANY 8/30/02

F1RM DATE

U037 704
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ERGON BIRMINGPORT PHONE NO. @ 436 3404 Aug. 26 2002 BS9:31AM PS
F.O.B. ANY DESTINATION IN COUNTY PER TON BY VENDOR’S TRUCKS 375
ITEM i QUANTITY UNIT PRICE
(TONS) F.0.B. COUNTYWIDE

AC-5 THROUGH 50 ,

AC-30 No Bid

MC-70 THROUGH 30 .

MC-3000 : No Bid

RC-70 THROUGH 30

RC-3000 No Bid

RS-2 30 * No Bid

CRS-2 30 ' $167.67/ton

CRs-2H 50 $167.67/ton

CRS-2p 500 | $203.66/ton

Mp 30 - No Bid

MP-{ 30 . ]
No Bid

EMULSIFIED PETROLEUM | 50

RESIN ‘No Bid

F.0.B. VENDOR’S PLANT
ITEM QUANTITY UNIT PRICE
(TONS) F.0.B. VENDOR’S PLANT

AC-5 THROUGH 30 .

AC-30 No Bid

Ir:{aco-;gof)}moumi 30 o Bid

RC-70 THROUGH 30 \

RC-3000 No Bid

RS-2 30 No Bid

CRs-2 30 $153.85/ton

CRS-ZH 30 $153.85/ton

CRS-2P 3,000 $203.66/ton

MP 30 No Bid

h'fp‘l 30 NO Bld

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc. August 27, 2002

FIRM DATE
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MEMBERS
Mixg RICHARDSON
GaARY YOUNGBLOOD
Bossy MILLER

W. FTarDy McCoriom
CHAIRMAN

Rowkrt HL JONNsTON

CLERK ReciNALD MURRAY
TuscaLoosa COUNTY ALABAMA
P.O. Box 20113 714 GREENSBORO AVENUE
TuscaLoosa, ALaBama 35402-0113

205-349-3870

August 22, 2002
Tuscaloosa Cooperative Whittemore Farms
Grassworks, Inc. Forestry Environmental Services
Buddy Jones Excavating Yellow Creek Farm
Gentlemen:

Tuscaloosa County ﬁill accept bids for hydroseeding along county
roads for the period from October 1, 2002, through September 30,
2003, until 9:00 a.m., Wednesday, September 4, 2002.

Bids can be mailed to: Tuscaloosa County Commission, P.0. Box 20013,
Tuscaloosa, AL 35402, or brought to the County Clerk's Office in the
Tuscaloosa County Courthouse prior to 9:00 a.m., Wednesday,
September 4, 2002.

Enclosed is the bid specification/bid submission form compiled by
the County Engineering Department. Direct all inquiries in regard
to this bid to County Engineer Bobby Hagler at telephone number
(205)345-6600.

To be more confident that your bid will be properly processed, please
return your bid in the "BID" envelope provided, or use the "BID"
envelope to address your bid package. Tuscaloosa County cannot accept
bids by telephone or fax machine.

A word to the wise - MAIL EARLY - overnight mail, including Airborne
Express, Federal Express, etc. does not always arrive by 9:00 a.m.
the next day.

Sincerely,

. Johnston

RHJ : 1ks

encl.

copy: file
Engineering

e

o U370 206



- 037 27 | T-5

BID SPECIFICATIONS FOR HYDRO-SEEDING & MULCHING

All materials required for hydro-seeding shall comply with the State of Alabama Department Of
Transportation Standard Specifications for Highway Construction, 2002 Edition. Special attention is
directed to Sections 656, 658 and 860 of the Specifications. Mix 2A and Mix 2AT as specified in Section
860.01(b) and Class A, Type 2 Mulching as specified in Section 656.01 and 860.03 in the Specifications
shall be used for all hydro-seeding.

All seed, lime, fertilizer, mulch, and any other material required for hydro-seeding shall be provided by the
contractor. ‘The contractor shall obtain a purchase order from the Tuscaloosa County Engineering
Department prior to beginning work.. The contractor shall begin work with a five (5} days notice from the
Tuscaloosa County Engineering Department, weather permitting,

All material testing, certifications, test reports, etc. as required by the Specifications shall be provided by the
contractor to the Tuscaloosa County Engineering Department.

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION BID QUANTITY BID PRICE (PER AC RE)
MULCHING
656-A CLASS A, TYPE 2 200 Acres 375.00
658-A HYDRO-SEEDING 500 Acres
760.00%

BY: Ll ) o
*There will be an additional § 100.00 per acre

FOR Whittemore Farms mobilization charge for orders of less than 5 acr

ADDRESS: 714 Benuett Road

Jasper, AL 35503

TELEPHONE: (205) 387-8549

DATE: §-30-04

The Bidder understands that the County reserves the right to reject any and all bids and to waive any
informalities involved in the bidding process. The quantities listed above are approximate only. There will
be no contract adjustments in the unit prices for any increase or decrease in the unit quantities. The Bidder
agrees that this bid shall be good for a period of one (1) year from the date of award. The Bidder agrees
that all orders for work shall be completed within five (5) working days from placement of such
order.

Frusers\allan'bids and budget infolcounty contracts\2002\hvdroseeding 200203

1-5



Aug 29 02 00:52a

ADDENDUM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS FOR HYDROSEEDING AND
MULCHING

ADDENDUM NO. 1

The following correction is made to the bid specifications:

The statement “The Bidder agrees that all orders for work shail be completed within
five (5) working days from placemeat of such order.”

Should read “The Bidder agrees that work shall begin within five (%) working days
from the placement of orders for work.”

This addendum shall be made a part of the Bid Specifications and Contract.

0.5



W. Haroy McCoLtum MEMBERS
CHAIRMAN Mixg RICHARDSOMN
GARY YOUNGBLOCD
RoOBERT H. JoHNsTON Bosny MILLER

CLERK REGINALD MURRAY

County COMMISSION

Tuscaroosa COUNTY ALABAMA
P.O. Box 20113 » 714 (GREENSBORO AVENUE
TuscaLoosa, ALaBamMa 35402-0113
205-349-3870 .
August 23, 2002

West Aiébama Concrete, Inc. Concrete Supply
Bama Concrete Products Co., Inc. Tri~County Concrete Construction

Kirkpatrick Concrete, Inc.
Gentlemens:

Tuscaloosa County will accept bids until 9:00 a.m., Wednesday, September 4, 2002,
for structural concrete to be used in constructing concrete structures for the period
from Qctober 1, 2002, through September 30, 2003.

The attached specifications and bid form were compiled by the - County Engineering
Department., Direct all inquiries in regard to this bid to County Engineer Bobby
Hagler at telephone number (205)345-6600.

Bids can be mailed to: Tuscaloosa County Commission, P.0. Box 20113, Tuscaloosa,
AL 35402, or brought to the County Clerk's Office in the Tuscaloosa County Courthouse
prior to 9:00 a.m., Wednesday, September 4, 2002.

A word to the wise - MAIL EARLY ~ overnight mail, including Airborme Express,
Federal Express, etc. does not always arrive by 9:00 a.m. the next day.

Please return your bid in the "BID" envelope provided, or use the "BID" envelope
to address your bid package to assure that your bid will be properly processed.

Sincerely,

Robert
Clerk

. Johnston

RHJ:1lks
encl,

copy: Englneering
file

1-b



TUSCALOOSA COUNTY
STRUCTURAL CONCRETE
CONTRACT SPECIFICATIONS AND BID FORM

| FOR

Furnishing to Tuscaloosa County, structural concrete, during the period October 1, 2002
through September 30, 2003, Materials to be furnished in mixes as indicated and
delivered to job sites countywide or the county bridge yard as directed. Materials to be
-furnished shall meet the requirements of the current edition of the Alabama Department of
Transportation Standard Specifications for Highway Construction, 2002 Edition
(hereinafter referred to as the “Specifications”). The supplier shall meet all requirements of
the Alabama Department of Transportation Manual on Materials, Sources, and Devices
with Special Acceptance Requirements. Particular attention is directed to Section 501.03
(d) 3.c. “Hot Weather Operations”. It shall be the responsibility of the supplier to
ensure that all temperature requirements are in accordance with the Specifications
at no additional costs to the County.

The class-type and quantities are listed below:

Precast, Nonprestressed Concrete for Bridge Members. 5,000 psi Design Strength.
Delivery Point: As directed by the Tuscaloosa County Engineering Department. The
minimum quantity ordered shall be 2 cubic yards.

Quantity | Unit | ltem Price/Unit Total
1500 C.Y. | Precast, Nonprestressed

Concrete, F.O.B. Bridge yard | {3, 0() [AY SO0, OO
100 C.Y. | Precast, Nonprestressed Fiber o

Reinforced Concrete, F.O.B.

Countywide SJ‘, 50 g NSO, OO

10 C.Y. | Class A-la Concrete, F.O.B.
Countywide N0.0°D 200. 0O
10 C.Y. | Class A-lc Concrete, F.O B. .
Countywide 10.00 00.00
10 C.Y. | Class B-3 Concrete, F. O.B. .
Countywide 10.00 OOO 00
10 C.Y. | Class A-2a Concrete, F. O B.
Countywide "0.00 7 o0 00

The _design mix for precast. nonprestressed concrete shali be submitted to and
approved by the Alabama Department of Transportation prior te batching amy
concrete. An approved design mix shall be on file at the Concrete Plant_and the
Office of the County Engineer.

st Adrae Corerete Tne Kop Mo 1%/?{/(&

FIRM Signature

-l

- 037 210
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TUSCALOOSA COUNTY
STRUCTURAL CONCRETE
CONTRACT SPECIFICATIONS AND BID FORM
FOR

Furnishing to Tuscaloosa County, structural concrete, during the period October 1, 2002
through September 30, 2003. Materials to be furnished in mixes as indicated and
delivered to job sites countywide or the county bridge yard as directed. Materials to be
“furnished shall meet the requirements of the current edition of the Alabama Department of
Transportation Standard Specifications for Highway Construction, 2002 Edition
(hereinafter referred to as the “Specifications”). The supplier shall meet all requirements of
the Alabama Department of Transportation Manual on Materials, Sources, and Devices
with Special Acceptance Requirements. Particular attention is directed to Section 501 03
(d) 3.c. “Hot Weather Operations”. It shall be the responsibility of the supplier to
ensure that all temperature requirements are in accordance with the Specifications
at no additional costs to the County.

The class-type and quantities are listed below:

Precast, Nonprestressed Concrete for Bridge Members. 5,000 psi Design Strength.
Delivery Point: As directed by the Tuscaloosa County Engineering Department. The
minimum quantity ordered shall be 2 cubic yards.

Quantity | Unit | ltem Price/Unit Total

1500 C.Y. | Precast, Nonprestressed
Concrete, F.O.B. Bridge yard ¥ 62.00 ¥ 93,000.00

100 CY. Pre?cast, Nonprestressed Fiber 66.50 6.650.00
Reinforced Concrete, F.O.B.
Countywide

10 C.Y. | Class A-la Concrete, F.O B,
Countywide 68.00 680.00
Countywide

10 CY. }Class B-3. Concrete, F.O.B. 63.00 630.00
Countywide

10 CY. Eloaj;tyA‘;Zi:eConcrete, F.OB. 68.00 68000

The design mix for precast., nonmprestressed concrete shall be submitted to Aand
approved by the Alabama Department of Tramsportation prior to batchin any
concrete. An approved design mix shall be on file at the Concrete Plant and the

Office of the County Engineer.

Bama Concrete Products Co., Inc, %/W 08/26/02

FIRM 7~ Signature Date

-6
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W. Flaroy McColLum MEMBERS

CHAIRMAN Mike RICHARDSON
GARY YOUNGBLOOD
Rosert H. JoHnsToN Bowey MILLER

CLERK RecivaLD MURRAy
County COMMISSION
Tuscaroosa CounNTy ALABAMA
P.O. Box 20113 = 714 GREENSBORO AVENUE
TuscarLoosa, ALasamMma 35402-0113
e 205-349-3870 -
August 23, 2002
Tuscaloosa Gin & Warehouse Co-op Terra International, Inc.
Tuscaloosa Farmers Co—-op Magnolia Chemical
Clark Mosquito Contrel Products Inc. Pure Corp.
Adapco, Inc. Vectec
Hill Manufacturing Co. Inc.
Gentlemen:

Tuscaloosa County will accept bids for Fyfanon, Mosquito Mist One, Punt 57-08,
Duet 8.8-0S ¢r equal mosquito contrel chemical until 9:00 a.m., Wednesday,
September 4, 2002, '

Bids shall include any freight, or delivery charge, to the Tuscaloosa County Shop
located at 2810 35th Street, Tuscaloosa, Alabama.

Direct all inquiries in regard to this bid to County Engineer Bobby Hagler at tele-
phone number (205)345-6600 between the hours of 7:00 a.m. and 3:30 p.m.

Bids can be majiled to: Tuscaloosa County Commission, P.0O. Box 20113, Tuscaloosa,
AL 35402, or brought to the County Clerk's Office in the Tuscaloosa County Courthouse
prior to 9:00 a.m., Wednesday, September 4, 2002,

Tuscaloosa County reserves the right to reject any or all bids and to accept the
bid best sulited to its needs, which takes into consideration both the lower price
and specified delivery date.

To be more confident that your bid will be properly processed, please return your
bid in the "BID" envelope provided, or use the "BID" envelope to address your bid

package.

A word to the wise - MAIL EARLY - overnight mail, including Airborne Express,
Federal Express, etc. does not always arrive by 9:00 a.m. the next day.

Sincerely,

724t

Robert H« Johnston
Clerk

RHJ:1ks
encl.

copy: Engineering
file

-]

o U370 212
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BID SHEET
MOSQUITO CHEMICALS
Bid Date: September 4, 2002

Fyfanon, Mosquito Mist One, Punt 57-0S, Duet 8.8-0S, or equal Mosquito control chemical

Chemical Bid: Mogquitomist One

Price Per Gallon: $  24.95

NOTE: Bidder to be responsible for removal of empty containers.

5-7 Business Days After Receipt of Order

Delivery Date

Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc.
Company Name

159 N. Garden Avenue, Roselle, IL 60172
Address

Sign%re : rLjL =

August 29, 2002
Date

800-323-5727 800-832-9344
Telephone Number / Fax Number

4.1
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