TUSCALOOSA COUNTY COMMISSION
MEETING
October 11, 2000

TUSCALOOSA COUNTY §
STATE OF ALABAMA §

This being the date and hour to which the Tuscaloosa County
Commission adjourned, the County Commission met pursuant to such

adjournment with Probate Judge W. Hardy McCollum presiding as

Chairman. The following members were present:

Mike Richardson
Gary Youngblood
Bobby Miller

Reginald Murray

Bids on base processing of Paul Mills Road were opened and
referred to the County Engineer for appropriate action.

Firms
submitting bids were as follows:

5.T. Bunn Construction Co., Inc.
Fair Contracting Co., Inc.

Exhibit 10-1, PagesH33-H40

Bids on earthwork on Paul Duncan Road were opened and referred
to the County Engineer for appropriate action.

Firms submitting
bids were as follows:

Fair Contracting Co., Inc.

GFC Construction Company
Racon, Inc.

Exhibit 10-2, Pages {4[-447
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Bids on disposal of thirteen (13) triaxle trucks and purchase
of thirteen (13) each 2001 model cab and chassis triaxle trucks
equipped with a sixteen foot dump body (21 c.y. capacity) were
opened and referred to the County Engineer for appropriate action.
Firms submitting bids were as follows:

Sprint Auction Co., Inc.

Truck City Ford Sales, Inc.

Alabama Truck Center (two quotes)

Northern Alabama Peterbilt - Warrior Tractor & Equipment Co.
J. W. Wood Auction Company, Inc.

Southland International Trucks, Inc.

Exhibit 10-3, Pages 44f-463

Planning Director Farrington Snipes made the following
announcements :

1. The prebid conference for the Mitt Lary Road bridges
will be held at 10:00 a.m. tomorrow. Bid opening for
the bridges is scheduled for 2:00 p.m. on the 17th
of October.

2. Bid opening on renovation of the old bus/trolley
station at Lurleen Wallace South and 7th Street is
scheduled for 2:00 p.m. tomorrow.

3. A Community Development Block Grant public hearing

for fiscal year 2001 will be held in Montgomery on
the 25th of October.

Commissioner Gary Youngblood moved, seconded by Commissioner
Mike Richardson, the County Commission voted unanimously to con-
tinue operating under the 1999-2000 budget until such time that
the 2000-2001 Tuscaloosa County budget is adopted.

-

Commissioner Bobby Miller moved, seconded by Commissioner
Mike Richardson, the County Commission voted unanimously to adopt
a resolution in which the county agrees to all terms and conditions
of a county joint bidding program as set forth in said resolution.
Tuscaloosa County further resolved by adoption of this resoclution
to enter into a joint bidding agreement with all other counties
participating in the county joint bidding program.

Exhibit 10-4, Pages‘{bq'q7[
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Commissioner Bobby Miller moved, seconded by Commissioner
Reginald Murray, the County Commission voted unanimously to adopt
a resolution in which Tuscaloosa County elects to participate in
the county credit card program developed by EFS National Bank
for counties in Alabama, and further elects to enter into an agree-
ment with EFS National Bank to provide these services pursuant
to the terms and conditions set out in its August 28, 2000, agree-
ment,

Exhibit 10-5, Page 41

Commissioner Gary Youngblood moved, seconded by Commissioner
Mike Richardson, the County Commission voted unanimously to honor
the request of the citizens of Kimberly Drive. The residents
want to pay the county two dollars per foot and have Tuscaloosa
County pave Kimberly Drive.

Commissioner Reginald Murray moved, seconded by Commissioner
Gary Youngblood, the County Commission voted unanimously to make
Bev Leigh an additional appointee to the Federal Flood Insurance
Program Committee.

Mr. Richard Burchfield, from Mountain View Lane, presented
the County Commission a petition requesting that the road known
as Mountain View Lane/Cedar Hill Drive be made safe.

Exhibit 10-6, Page4473

There being no further business to come before the Tuscaloosa
County Commission, the meeting adjourned to Wednesday, October 25,
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W. Haroy McCoLLum MEMBERS
CHAIRMAN MIKE RICHARDSON
Gary YOUNGBLOOD
Roserr H. JoHNSTON Bossy MILLER
CLERK ReGINALD MURRAY
TuscaLoosa COUNTY ALABAMA
P.O. Box 20113 » 714 GREENSBORO AVENUE
TuscaLoosa, ALasama 35402-0113
205-349-3870
September 26, 2000
Racon, Inc. Tony Booth Construction Co.
Sartain Lumber & Contracting Fair Contracting
Barnes Excavating Co., Inc. Buddy Jones Excavating
Melvin Sellers Excavating Co. . Ralph Rice Excavating
Woodruff & Associates Mallory Burkhalter Paving, Inc.
West Contracting S. T. Bunn Construction Co., Inc.
Gurganus & Sons Excavating W.S. Newell, INc.
Ryan Shirley, Inc. PIW, Inc.
GFC Construction, Inc. APAC Alabama
Gentlemen:

Tuscalocosa County will accept bids for base processing on Paul Mills
Road until 9:00 a.m., Wednesday, October 11, 2000. Attached are bid
submission form and specifications for said project.

Direct all inquiries in regard to this bid to Engineering Coordinator
Mike Henderson at telephone number (205)345-6600 between the hours of
7:00 a.m. and 3:30 p.m. Monday through Friday.

Bids can be mailed to: Tuscaloosa County Commission, P. 0. Box 20113,
Tuscaloosa, AL 35402, or brought to the County Clerk's Office in the
Tuscaloosa County Courthouse prior to 9:00 a.m., Wednesday, October 11,
2000.

A word to the wise - MAIL EARLY - overnight mail, including Airborne
Express, Federal Express, etc. does not always arrive by 9:00 a.m.
the next morning. X
Please return your bid in the "BID" envelope provided, or use the
"BID" envelope to address your bid package to assure that your bid
is delivered to the correct office.

Sincerely,

Rober#f H. Johnston

10—/
RHJ: 1lks

encl.
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rAUL MILLS ROAD PROJECT BID SHEET

30f5

DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY

UNIT

UNIT PRICE

BID AMOUNT

BITUMINOQUS
TREATMENT
TYPE “A”
(Contingency
Item)

7,744

SYCIP

BE5

4259.20

BASE
PROCESSING

32

Roadbed
Station

Q9% .00

95 36.20

TOTAL

| B795 .20

The Bidder understands that the county reserves the right to reject any and ali bids and to waive any
informalities involved in the bidding process. The quantities listed above are approximate only. There will
be no contract adjustments in the unit prices for any increase or decrease in the unit quantities.

Company Name: _ ST Buwpw Gensr, (_.o.i']:mc.,

Mailing Address: 1§04 W avins Ty

Telephone:

E)\_un.

15K-%145

Name: gb%ﬁ V\\A\\‘\
M\

Title:

PKES:OG.MT

Date:

[0-140-2000

File; f:fusers/bobby/winword/mischids/PaulMills Processing.doc

Ay
UL,

035 439

Tuscaceesa, An 35441



PAUL MILLS ROAD PROJECT BID SHEET TO -

DESCRIPTION | QUANTITY |UNIT [ UNIT PRICE | BID AMOUNT
BITUMINOUS
TREATMENT
TYPE “A”

(Contingency 7,744 SYCIP $ o $ 5 ?LZ 0, 8@_
Ttem) .
BASE Roadbed
PROCESSING | 32 Station ¥300.00 39400.00

TOTAL - | $/5020.80

The Bidder understands that the county reserves the right to reject any and all bids and to waive any
informalitics involved in the bidding process. The quantitics listed above are approximate only. There will
be no contract adjustments in the unit prices for any increase or decrease in the unit quantities.

Company Name: /E;:'r &n#‘?ﬂ(n’j G. Tne

Mailing Address: £© Box 71149 fscaloosq, Al 35407

Telephone: 205 - 75 2-/758

Name: (\4?1‘/'{, /%ﬂ?r?@f
Title: / /9

Date: ﬁ/&- 9" (00

File: f/users/bobby/winword/mischbids/PaulMills Processing.doc



W. Harpy McCorLLum MEMBERS

CHAIRMAN Mixe RicHARDSON
GARY YOUNGBLOCD
Roeert H. JoHNSTON Bossy MILLER
CLERK ReciNALD MURRAY
TuscaLoosa CoOUNTY ALABAMA
P.O. Box 20113 » 714 GREENSBORO AVENUE
TuscaLoosa, ALaBama 35402-0113
205-349-3870
September 26, 2000
Racon, Inc. GFC Construction, Inc.
Sartain Lumber & Constracting Tony Booth Construction Co.
Barnes Excavating Co., Inc. Fair Contracting
Melvin Sellers Excavating Co. Buddy Jones Excavating
Woodruff & Associates ' Ralph Rice Excavating
West Contracting Co. S & M Excavating
Gurganus & Sons Excavating PIW, Inc.

Ryan Shirley, Inc.
Gentlemen:

Tuscaloosa County will accept bids for earthwork and associated con-
struction on Paul Duncan Road until 9:00 a.m., Wednesday, October 11,
2000, Attached are bid submission form and specifications for said
project.

Direct all inquiries in regard to this bid to Engineering Coordinator
Mike Henderson at telephone number (205)345-6600 between the hours
of 7:00 a.m. and 3:30 p.m. Monday through Friday.

Bids can be mailed to: Tuscaloosa County Commission, P. 0. Box 20113,
Tuscaloosa, AL 35402, or brought to the County Clerk's Office in the
Tuscaloosa County Courthbouse prior to 9:00 a.m., Wednesday, October 11,
2000.

A word to the wise - MAIL EARLY - overnight mail, including Airborne
Express, Federal Express, etc. does not always arrive by 9:00 a.m.
the next morning.

Please return your bid in the "BID" envelope provided, or use the
"BID" envelope to address your bid package to assure that your bid
is delivered to the correct office.

Sincerely,

?77

Robert H. Jobnston
Clerk Jo - 2

t

RHJ: 1ks

encl.

e 035 A4 /O’B\
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BID SHEET 1 OF 2

+UL DUNCAN ROAD PROJECTE SHEET

Tof |

ITEM NO.

DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY

UNIT

UNIT
PRICE

BID AMOUNT

301A-000

CLEARING AND
GRUBBING

5 ACRES

LUMP
SUM

2000.00

[S000.00

210A-000

UNCLASSIFIED
EXCAVATION
PER CUBIC YD.
HAULED

7,800

CU.YD.

2..5

1 '71650.00

210A-001

¥ MILE
OVERHAUL
UNIT

750

CU.YD.

225

[6R7.50

210D-001

BORROW
EXCAVATION

5,200

CU.YD.

.50

33%00.00

301A-106

SOIL
AGGREGATE
BASE COURSE,
TYPE “A”,
ROAD MIXED,
8” COMPACTED
THICKNESS

11,700

SYCIP

770

31590.00

530A-001

18" ROADWAY
PIPE (CLASS I1I
R.C.)

190

LIN. FT.

9.5

3733.50

530A-002

24" ROADWAY
PIPE (CLASS III
R.C)

272

LIN. FT.

31.60

<56%.00

530A-004

30° ROADWAY
PIPE (CLASS 111
R.C.)

58

LIN. FT.

46 &S

1705.70

535A-540

15” SIDE DRAIN
PIPE
16 GUAGE C.M.

360

LIN. FT.

13,70

49372 .00

535A-541

18” SIDE DRAIN
PIPE
16 GUAGE C.M.

316

LIN. FT.

lbao

5087.bo

535A-542

24” SIDE DRAIN
PIPE
16 GUAGE C.M.

52

LIN. IT.

20,25

1063.00

610C-001

LOOSE RIPRAP,
CLASSII

75

TON

18.%0

13¢7.50

634A-001

INDUSTRIAL
FENCE, 5’ HIGH

285

LIN. FT.

Q.00

25(65.00

634D-001

GATE, 6° WIDE,
COMPLETE
WITH FITTINGS
WITHOUT
BARBED WIRE

EACII

H00,00

top.oo

635A-001

WOVEN WIRE
FENCE

235

LIN. FT.

5.00

175 00

636A-001

BARBED WIRE

Zﬁt/cmﬁﬁﬁ%'ﬁajwﬁ'

In.n.



FENCE, 3
STRANDS, 4’
HIGH

525

LIN. FT.

2.00

/0 50.00

636A-002

BARBED WIRE
FENCE, 4
STRANDS, 4°
HIGH

125

LIN. FT.

2.50

312.50

637A-001

FENCE RESET
(CONTRACTOR
SHALL
FURNISH 6
EACH 47X4"
TREATED
TIMBER POSTS)

66

LIN. FT.

.00

330.00

665F-001

HAY BALES

25

EACH

o000

250.00

6651-001

TEMPORARY
RIPRAP, CLASS
I

50

TON

20,00

/©00.00

665J-001

SILT FENCE,
TYPE “A”

250

LIN. FT.

L.oo

IS00.00D

[O0TAL

Bot i

33567730

Foie fmilied,

035

CM@/,MW-

Fu Lontost23-

443

17

[OReEN
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PAUL DUNCAN ROAD PROJECT BID SHEET

BID SHEET 1 OF 2

ITEM NO.

DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY

UNIT

UNIT
PRICE

BID AMOUNT

201A-000

CLEARING AND
GRUBBING

5 ACRES

LUMP
SUM

6,600.00

33,000.00

210A-000

UNCLASSIFIED
EXCAVATION
PER CUBIC YD.
HAULED

7,800

CU.YD.

1.00

7,800.00

210A-001

2 MILE
OVERHAUL
UNIT

750

CU.YD.

1.00

750.00

210D-001

BORROW
EXCAVATION

5,200

CU.YD.

6.00

31,200.00

301A-106

SOIL
AGGREGATE
BASE COURSE,
TYPE “A”,
ROAD MIXED,
8” COMPACTED
THICKNESS

11,700

SYCIP

9.00

105,300.00

530A-001

18" ROADWAY
PIPE (CLASS 11}
R.C)

190

LIN. FT.

24,00

4,560.00

530A-002 -

74" ROADWAY
PIPE (CLASS IiI
R.C)

272

LIN. FT.

30.00

8,160.00

530A-004

30" ROADWAY
PIPE (CLASS III
R.C.)

58

LIN. FT.

40.00

2,320.00

535A-540

15” SIDE DRAIN
PIPE
16 GUAGE C.M,

360

LIN. FT.

16.00

5,760.00

S35A-541

18” SIDE DRAIN
PIPE
16 GUAGE C.M.

316

LIN. FT.

18.00

5,688.00

535A-542

24” SIDE DRAIN
PIPE
16 GUAGE C. M.

52

LIN. FT.

22.00

1,144.00

610C-001

LOOSE RIPRAP,
CLASSII

75

TON

30.00

2,250.00

634A-001

INDUSTRIAL
FENCE, 5’ HIGH

285

10.00

2,850,00

634D-001

GATE, 6’ WIDE,
COMPLETE
WITH FITTINGS
WITHOUT
BARBED WIRE

LIN. FT.

EACH

500.00

500.00

635A-001

WOVEN WIRE
FENCE

235

LIN. FT.

5.00

636A-001

BARBED WIRE

1,175.00

HFC fobaceCiin

Tof Il

lﬂ,_‘;k



FENCE, 3
STRANDS, 4’
HIGH

525

LIN. FT.

5.00

2,625.00

636A-002

BARBED WIRE
FENCE, 4
STRANDS, 4’
HIGH

125

LIN. FT.

5.00

625.00

637A-001

FENCE RESET
(CONTRACTOR
SHALL
FURNISH 6
EACH 4"X4”
TREATED
TIMBER POSTS)

66

LIN. FT.

10,00

6£60.00

665F-001

HAY BALES

25

EACH

5.00

125.00

6651-001

TEMPORARY
RIPRAP, CLASS
1l

50

TON

30.00

1,500.60

665J-001

SILT FENCE,
TYPE “A”

250

LIN. FT.

4.00

1,000.00

MFe il

Total

218,992.00

o

[0-2\



PAUL DUNCAN ROAD PROJECT BID SHEET

BID SHEET 1 OF 2

ITEM NO.

DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY

UNIT

UNIT
PRICE

BID AMOUNT

201A-000

CLEARING AND
GRUBBING

5 ACRES

LUMP
SUM

el

(,05_,000"'@‘

210A-000

UNCLASSIFIED
EXCAVATION
PER CUBIC YD.
HAULED

7,800

CU.YD.

0o,
3

23,4060.00

210A-001

¥ MILE
OVERHAUL
UNIT

750

CU.YD.

O

_B_.

210D-001

BORROW
EXCAVATION

5,200

CU.YD.

oo
L=

20,300.00

301A-106

SOIL
AGGREGATE
BASE COURSE,
TYPE “A”,
ROAD MIXED,
8” COMPACTED
THICKNESS

11,700

SYCIP

Ne,

146,950.00

530A-001

18" ROADWAY
PIPE (CLASS Iil
R.C)

190

LIN. FT.

A5.63

48¢9.70

530A-002

24" ROADWAY
PIPE (CLASS 11l
R.C.)

272

LIN. FT.

33.33%

a065.7%

530A-004

30" ROADWAY
PIPE (CLASS 111
R.C)

58

LIN. FT.

4750

2755.00

535A-540

15” SIDE DRAIN
PIPE
16 GUAGE C.M.

360

LIN. FT.

16,91

L1 09.20

535A-541

18” SIDE DRAIN
PIPE
16 GUAGE C.M.

3i6

LIN. FT.

.28

5334 6%

535A-542

24” SIDE DRAIN
PIPE
16.GUAGE C.M.

52

LIN. FT.

18.70

A72.40

610C-001

LOOSE RIPRAP,
CLASSII

75

TON

00

25—

1875.0C

634A-001

INDUSTRIAL
FENCE, 5’ HIGH

285

LIN. FT.

10.5%

5
3/00(0.7

634D-001

GATE, 6 WIDE,
COMPLETE
WITH FITTINGS
WITHOUT
BARBED WIRE

EACH

7/4°°

-]

714

635A-001

WOVEN WIRE
FENCE 0%

235

LIN. FT.

636A-001

BARBED WIRE

| 450, %°

Locm , TV

Tof |l

'9-2



Bof

FENCE, 3 525 LIN. FT.

STRANDS, 4 Jo o

HIGH 4 Q, 205"
636A-002 | BARBED WIRE !

FENCE, 4 125 LIN. FT.

STRANDS, 4 S0 vo

HIGH 4, 5as.
637A-001 | FENCE RESET

(CONTRACTOR

SHALL 66 LIN. FT.

FURNISH 6

EACH 4”X4”

TREATED d

TIMBER POSTS) /5, 75 15395
665F-001 | HAY BALES 25 EACH | /,-P2e- 150.00
6651001 | TEMPORARY 00

RIPRAP, CLASS | 50 TON |\787 | 250.00

1
6651-001 | SILT FENCE, 00

TYPE “A” 250 LIN.FT. | 4 [000.00

—ota| ¥142,501.89
feacta., Le
3172 '
o 035 0 447
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W. Harpy McCoLLum M M;Z{IMBERS
CHAIRMAN IKE RICHARDSON
Gany YOUNGBLOOD
RoserT H. JOHNSTON Bobey MiLLER

CLERK RecINALD MURRAY
County COMMISSION
TuscaLoosa COUNTY ALABAMA
P.O. Box 20113 ¢ 714 (GREENSBOROC AVENUE
TuscaLoosa, ALaBaMa 35402-0113
205-349-3870
September 26, 2000
Mack Sales of Birmingham, Inc. Locklear Dodge City
Long-Lewis Ford Liberty Truck Sales
Tuscaloosa Motor Company Barkley Pontiac-GMC
Townsend Ford Southland International
Northern Alabama Peterbilt J. M. Wood Auction Co., Inc.
General Truck Equipment, Inc. Sprint Auction Co.
Ritchie Brothers Forke Brothers
Truck City Ford
Gentlemen:

Tuscaloosa County will accept bids on thirteen (13) each 2001 model
cab and chassis triaxle trucks equipped with a 16' dump body (21 c.y.
capacity) until 9:00 a.m., Wednesday, October 11, 2000.

Attached are minimum specifications compiled by the Tuscaloosa County
Engineering Department. Direct all inquiries in regard to this bid
to County Engineer Bobby Hagler at telephone number (205)345-6600.

Bids can be mailed to: Tuscaloosa County Commission, P.0. Box 20113,
Tuscaloosa, AL 35402, or brought to the County Clerk's Office in the

Tuscaloosa County Courthouse prior to 9:00 a.m., Wednesday, October 11,
2000.

Bid shall include all freight, delivery, etc. charges. Bid should
state condition of warranty.

A word to the wise - MAIL EARLY - overnight mail including Airborne
Express, Federal Express, etc. does not always arrive by 9:00 a.m.
the next morning.

Please return your bid in the "BID" envelope provided, or use the
"BID" envelope to address your bid package to assure that your bid
is delivered to the correct office.

Sincerely,

R%ﬁm

Clerk
RHJ:1lks

encl. Jo - %



Sprint Guction Co.

Fhw, 19Soralt
P.O. Box 1188

Philadelplia,

Ms. 39350 >
601-656-6440 - -
Fax 601-656-0113 -— -

October 11, 2000
Tuscaloesa County Commission
P.O. Box 20113
Tuscaloosa, Al 35402-0113

Dear Sirs:

Per our inspection of the equipment, listed on the accompanying sheet marked
“Exhibit A”, we are pleased to present the following auction proposal for liquidation of said
equipment.

SERVICES OFFERED:

=

Provide insurance — one million-dollar premises liability for sale.
Provide all licenses or bonds required for this sale.
Guarantee all sales proceeds and assume responsibility for collection of funds.
Provide security for the sale.
Catalog, inventory, verify descriptions and set up sale order.
Provide a detailed buyers guide with descriptions of each piece of equipment, terms
of the sale, checkout procedure, and removal dates.
Provide shuttle service to and from airport for buyers attending the sale.
. Provide concessions (reasonably priced food & drink) for sale.
Collect and submit all applicable state sales taxes for sale.
Pay all advertising expenses for the sale.
. Take pictures, layout and design a full-color brochure for the sale.
Pay all printing costs and postage for mail-out of said full-color brochure.
. Make any suggestions for minor repairs or refurbishment that will help this
equipment bring the most money.
Make full settlement to Tuscaloosa County within 3 working day of the sale.

Provide transportation of county equipment for sale from Tuscaloosa, AL to the
auction site in Philadelphia, MS.

SEHOOR R

0Z ZrRETEO



e 035 450

Sprint gaction Co.

Fhvy. 19Souah
P.Q. Box 1188
Phitaclelphica,
Ms. 39350 -~
601-656-6440 > =

Fav 601-656-0113 -

2. LOCATION OF SALL:

Sale to be conducted at our permanent, all-weather, drive-thru auction facility in
Philadelphia, MS adjacent to Barrett Field Airstrip on Highway 19 South. Sale site
improvements continue to be made each year and we now have one of the nicest facilities
in the Southeast. The recent addition of motels, restaurants, camper sites, and attractions
to the Philadelphia area have made this location more enticing that ever to our buyers
coming from other areas of the country. All equipment should be delivered 7 days before
the auction. :

3. DATE OF SALE RECOMMENDED:

Sprint Auction would strongly recommend our End of March, 2001 Auction. This
Huge Contractor’s Equipment Sale will attract buyers from all over the world and is
predicted to be one of our best sales of the year. We will mail our full mailing list
consisting of over 55, 000 credible buyers for this sale.

4. REPAIRS & REFURBISHMENT:

The Tuscaloosa County equipment listed in “Exhibit A” shall be in the same condition
as when appraised, other than normal wear and tear. All pieces should crank on their
own power, have no flat tires (tread depth should be a minimum of 50% on all tires), or
similar problems that would hinder the drive-thru auction.

5. APPRAISAL OF EQUIPMENT TO BE SOLD:

After our inspection of the equipment, marked “Exhibit A”, we offer appraisal of said
equipment in the amount of § 67 00 if sold at absolute public auction at our
permanent all-weather auction facility in Philadelphia, MS in the End of March, 2001
Sale.




Sprint guction Co.

Fhwy, 19Sowah
P.O. Box 1188
Philadelphia,
Ay, 39350 -
601-656-6440 =

Fav 601-656-0/13

6. COMMISSION RATE:

A. Straight Commission Sale: Sprint Auction co., Inc. will conduct the sale of the
above mentioned equipment for a straight commission of six_percent (6%) of the last
bid made or received, due and payable day of sale, to be with-held from the auction
settlement.

B. Guarantee Gross Sale: Sprint Auction Co., will guarantee gross sales of the above
mentioned equipment to be no less than the appraised value as mentioned in Item #5,
less _cight percent (8%) commission charged for the guaranteed sale. Tuscaloosa
County will receive a bond check guaranteed by a bank letter in the amount of
§ ¢Z2 9 4o prior to the auction.

Thank you for allowing us the opportunity to submit this proposal to Tuscaloosa
County. We earnestly solicit your business and can assure you that we will work hard to
make this sale of surplus equipment profitable for you.

Sincerely,

Chuck o,

Chuck Easler
Sprint Auction Co., Inc.
Alabama Lic. #1590

035 451 0-3
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Sprint @action Co.

Fhuwn, 195outh
P.O. Box 1188
Philactelphia,
Ms. 39350 -~
601 -656-6440 -~ -
Fax 601-656-0113 —_ -

“Exhibit A”
LISTING OF EQUIPMENT FROM TUSCALOOSA COUNTY
County#
232 1996 Mack RD688S Tri-Axle Dump Truck, s/n TM0258438
231 1996 Mack RD688S Tri-Axle Dump Truck, s/n TM028547
131 1996 Mack RD688S Tri-Axie Dump Truck, s/n TM028546
132 1996 Mack RD688S Tri-Axle Dump Truck, s/n TM028545
128 1995 Mack RD688S Tri-Axle Dump Truck, s/n SM024381
228 1995 Mack RD688S Tri-Axle Dump Truck, s/n SM024380
126 1993 Mack RD688S Tri-Axle Dump Truck, s/n PM016196
133 1999 Navistar/International 2574 Tri-Axle Dump Truck, s/n XH613539
233 1999 Navistar/International 2574 Tri-Axle Dump Truck, s/n XH561670
130 1991 Peterbilt 357 Tri-Axle Dump Truck, s/n MD311192
230 | 1991 Peterbilt 357 Tri-Axle Dump Truck, s/n MD311191
229 1991 Peterbilt 357 Tri-Axle Dump Truck, s/n MD311190
129 1991 Peterbilt 357 Tri-Axle Dump Truck, s/n MD311189
Tuscaloosa County Commission Sprint Auction Co., Inc.



BID FOR CAB AND CHASSIS TRUCK.
TRIAXLE DUMP TRUCK

Bid ltem

Base Bid

Base Bid

Cab and Chassis Truck TriAxle

(Dump Body Included)

Guaranteed Delivery In 90 days or less.

Base Bid '

Cab and Chassis Truck TriAxle

(Dump Body Included)

Guaranteed Delivery In 180 days or less.

Option #1;
48 Month Purchase Plan
Annual Payment

BID FOR USED CAB AND CHASSIS TRUCK
TRIAXLE DUMP TRUCK

Bid Item

Base Bid

ade-In, Individual Bi

. [ ESS  ComlanSSron”

Jrade-In, Individual Bid, or ~=———" - ‘
]@uaranteed Auction Consignment Price 1\——; W ¢ W

Tuscaloosa County reserves to right to sell
all, none, or any number of trucks at the bid

price.

)
i

#232 - 1996 Mack RD688S S/N TM028548
#231 - 1996 Mack RD688S S/N TM028547
#131 - 1996 Mack RD688S S/N TM028546
#132 - 1996 Mack RD688S S/N TM028545
#128 - 1995 Mack RD688S S/N SM024381
#228 - 1995 Mack RD688S S/N SM024380

#126_-,‘L9-95'Mack RD688S S/N PM0O16196
/997

4/0, 000
4/, 0, 900
40, ooo
440, 900
35, coo
35, 0o0
25, coo




o 035 . 4%

- #133 - 1999 International 2574 S/N XH613538 50, 0
#233 - 1999 International 2574 S/N XH561670 50, 00O
#130 - 1991 Peterbilt 357 S/N MD311192 75,0
#230 - 1991 Peterbilt 357 S/N MD311191 25, ©oo
#229 - 1991 Peterbilt 357 S/N MD311190 25,032
#129 - 1991 Peterbilt 357 S/N MD311189 25, 02

SEE Aucrron 202087

Specify Delivery Date:
Foe LUMO Siwr?  ON A TRUCLS

Model:

Description:

Title Fees:

Other:

Name of Company: \SW’% /4/[74/(3’&/ C@
Mailing Address: %\Q //éjg /MA&&//A@% ﬁjj@

Telephone: | /40/’ éé—é O//3 M/
Name: éO/ éié QWO /D/f

Title: | ﬂc? (‘;&VW&L—/ //5/(/ /%
e /a////aﬁ Z 4 (5

File: f/users/bobbyfwinword/equipbids/truck00.doc



BID FOR CAB AND CHASSIS TRUCK
TRIAXLE DUMP TRUCK

Bid Item Base Bid

Base Bid

Cab and Chassis Truck TriAxle

(Dump Body included) :
Guaranteed Delivery In 90 days or less. _See Attached Lease Quote per Your Request.

~ Base Bid

Cab and Chassis Truck TriAxle

(Dump Body Included)

Guaranteed Delivery In 180 days or less. ""NO BID"

Option #1:
48 Month Purchase Plan

Annual Payment See Attached Lease Quote per Your Request.

BID FOR USED CAB AND CHASSIS TRUCK
TRIAXLE DUMP TRUCK

Bid item Base Bid

Trade-In, Individual Bid, or

Guaranteed Auction Consignment Price
Tuscaloosa County reserves to right {o sell
all, none, or any number of trucks at the bid

price.

#232 - 1996 Mack:RD688S SIN TM028548 $45000.00
#231 - 1996 Mack RD688S S/N TM028547 $45000.00
#131 - 1996 Mack RD688S S/N TM028546 $42000.00
#132 - 1096 Mack RD688S S/N TM028545 $45000.00
#128 - 1995 Mack RD688S S/N SM024381 | $42000,00
#228 - 1995 Mack RD688S S/N SM024380 $42000.00
#126 - 199% Mack RD688S S/N PM016196 $34000.00

5 of 1
Tawed 27 Tl '

o 035 455 | [0/5



coe 935 0 456

#133 - 1999 International 2574 S/N XH613539 $42500.00
#233 - 1999 International 2574 SN XH561670 $42500..00
#130 - 1991 Peterbilt 357 S/N MD311192 $25000.00
#230 - 1991 Peterbilt 357 S/N MD311191 $25000.00
#229 - 1991 Peterbilt 357 SIN MD311190 42500000
#1209 - 1991 Peterbilt 357 S/N MD311189 ~ $25000.00:
Specify Delivery Date: Within 90 days of Placing Order

Mode!: Sterling LT9511

Description: Tri-Axle Dump Truck

Title Fees: Included in price of truck

Ofther:

Name of Company: Truck City Ford Sales Inc.

Telephone;  (205) 324-8661

Name: Steve Farmer or Lefoy Raymond
Title: Commercial Sales
Date: 16=10-00

Flte: t:fusers/bobbyiwinword/equipbidstruck00.doc

/1/,7 /‘/’



TUSCALOOSA COUNTY COMMISSION 10/11/00
P.O. BOX 20113

TUSCALOOSA ,ALABAMA 35402

REFERENCE TRIAXLE DUMP BID

THANK YOU FOR THIS OPPORTUNITY TO BID

PLEASE FIND ATTACHED INFORMATION REQUETSED IN YOUR
BID SPEC.

I.PRICING ON SPECIFIED CHASSIS AND BODY EQUIPMENT
2.BID BOND ON NEW EQUIPMENT BID

3.FINANCE PROPOSAL REQUESTED IN BID SPEC

4. TRADE IN VALULES ON 13 USED UNITS

5.BID BOND ON USED UNITS

PLEASE NOTE AND CONSIDER THIS LETTER A PART OF
OUR BID:

BUY BACK OPTION

THE BUY BACK OPTION REQUESTED WITHIN BID SPECS WILL
PLACE TUSCALOOSA COUNTY IN A POSITION THAT WE FEEL
WILL VOID THE FRET TAX EXEMPT STATUS OF TUSCALOOSA
COUNTY . PLEASE REVIEW ATTACHED INFORMATION SUPPLIED
BY ATD MANAGEMENT GUIDE ON FEDERAL EXCISE TAX
COMPLIANCE. BASED ON THIS INFORMATION WE CANNOT
SUBMIT A BUY BACK OPTION, ‘

WE AGAIN APPRECIATE THIS INVITATION TO BID AND LOOK
FORWARD TO SUPPLYING YOUR TRUCK NEEDS.

BRUCE GRAHAM
SALES MANAGER

(lobrrrie Toueh (nli

e 035 457 | !0’5



#133 - 1999 International 2574 S/N XH613539 § 42,560
#233 - 1999 International 2574 S/N XH561670 ¥ 42,50
#130 - 1991 Peterbilt 357 S/N MD311192 AL
#230 - 1991 Peterbilt 357 S/N MD311191 ¥ 26000
#220 - 1991 Peterbilt 357 S/N MD311190 $+ 25000

#129 - 1991 Peterbilt 357 S/N MD311189 1 25,000

Specify Delivery Date: SFQC ""ﬁccl an C;v\"""
Model: WeSHLG\ g—b/ Jqel =X 200 | Yg w

Description: [nox le :DWP

Title Fees: inc buded

Other:

Name of Company: Alabauw. Trd Couder

Mailing Address: Sioi \r?or’l" ‘-’11»% g:rm n ‘\L, ol 35203

Telephone: %v-749- S46o /3105'—3.;11 .25'3‘#/0703"' 325 -1085 FAX
Name: Ruc . Bus l"'~/ / Ewce_ CSrahaim
Title: SQ les Q‘b(? SCF L': mawa_ﬁle_/

Date: lO/" foo

File: flusers/bobbyiwinword/equipbids/iruck00.doc
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BID FOR CAB AND CHASSIS TRUCK
TRIAXLE DUMP TRUCK

Bid item 001 Western Star 4ACHEX Base Bid ¥ §0 245 00 each

Base Bid Re Fme of bid opening wWestern SHar
Cab and Chassis Truck TriAxle c.f:rld bul1d  Hhese ME?{_‘; late Oct or

(Dump Body Included) Cocly b/ . basedd
Guaranteed Delivery In 90 days or less. 7 no/. del-w:% Contd he made base

o hme of order — Lale Nol-—, E\ﬁr'w Deec..-

Base Bid

Cab and Chassis Truck TriAxle

(Dump Body included)

Guaranteed Delivery In 180 days or less.

Option #1: Futl  Tofals of Troue Pan Attzched

48 Month Purchase Plan

Annual Payment 46’ M ‘ §73 252 io

Months nn Wiy 0 s — ¥ 43,252,
€
6157,
BID FOR USED CAB AND CHASSIS TRUCK
TRIAXLE DUMP TRUCK
Bi - Base Bid
id item i3 Used Unds -T;-pr o de ase Bi 51'4&3'&00
Trade-In, Individual Bid, or . -
Guaranteed Auction Consignment Price [rade \/"‘“t‘*‘- O‘La,

Tuscaloosa County reserves to right to sell
all, none, or any number of trucks at the bid

price.

#232 - 1996 Mack RD688S S/N TM028548 §  4Seeo
#231 - 1996 Mack RD688S S/N TM028547 Foasieoo
#131 - 1996 Mack RD688S S/N TM028546 + 45,000
#132 - 1996 Mack RD688S S/N TM028545 +  4< 000
#128 - 1995 Mack RD688S S/N SM024381 ¢ 42,000
#228 - 1995 Mack RD688S S/N SM024380 ¥ 42,000

1 34 oo O

#126 - 1995 Mack RD688S S/N PM016196
14973

e 35 4-5% 10’3



TUSCALOOSA COUNTY COMMISSION ~10/11/00
P.O. BOX 20113

TUSCALOOSA ,ALABAMA 35402

REFERENCE TRIAXLE DUMP BID

THANK YOU FOR THIS OPPORTUNITY TO BID

PLEASE FIND ATTACHED INFORMATION REQUETSED IN YOUR
BID SPEC.

I.PRICING ON SPECIFIED CHASSIS AND BODY EQUIPMENT
2.BID BOND ON NEW EQUIPMENT BID

3.FINANCE PROPOSAL REQUESTED IN BID SPEC

4. TRADE IN VALUES ON 13 USED UNITS

5.BID BOND ON USED UNITS

PLEASE NOTE AND CONSIDER THIS LETTER A PART OF
OUR BID:

BUY BACK OPTION

THE BUY BACK OPTION REQUESTED WITHIN BID SPECS WILL
PLACE TUSCALOOSA COUNTY IN A POSITION THAT WE FEEL
WILL VOID THE FRET TAX EXEMPT STATUS OF TUSCALOOSA
COUNTY . PLEASE REVIEW ATTACHED INFORMATION SUPPLIED
BY ATD MANAGEMENT GUIDE ON FEDERAL EXCISE TAX
COMPLIANCE. BASED ON THIS INFORMATION WE CANNOT
SUBMIT A BUY BACK OPTION.

WE AGAIN APPRECIATE THIS INVITATION TO BID AND LOOK
FORWARD TO SUPPLYING YOUR TRUCK NEEDS.

BRUCE GRAHAM -
SALES MANAGER RYY. Vieceate AT



Ala boua, | rnech— Ceiderr

BID FOR CAB AND CHASSIS TRUCK
TRIAXLE DUMP TRUCK

a ] Toubie i .

Bid ltem Vool Wack Rb688 3 Rcau(_h‘ogase Bid ¢ g1 37% ¢ el

Base Bid Flease. note: prce acludes —aird axle wAk rims thed

Cab and Chassis Truck TriAxle ~ W«s  wot  sSpecofied 7o b, d spec.

(Dump Body Included) ‘ '

Guaranteed Delivery In 90 days or less. A+ ~me of bid OpPening WC L‘m‘“'
5~ Chassis  [n stock et Can be delivere'd wrt s

Base Bid A Wee ¢ s Balance of order Could be
Cab and Chassis Truck TriAxle  delivered lobe. Tanwaram A ordered
(Dump Body Included) ~ received  wiBin  mext  bus@ness week
Guaranteed Delivery In 180 days or less.

ol
Option #1: Tt ]s of
48 Month Purchase Plan :
Annual Payment F;n&h ce ﬂ"m Attache d

48 ™MOS.  Gnnual sz‘i‘s ‘A Qvrearys = $ QB,S"éSt 72
. <,
BID FOR USED CAB AND CHASSIS TRUCK .15 A
TRIAXLE DUMP TRUCK »

Bid ltem 13 Used '_ Units Toted Teade Base Bid-”"f-gi.’, 00D
_ Trade T Value On by

Trade-In, Individual Bid; or :
Guaranteed Auction Consignment Price
Tuscaloosa County reserves to right to sell

all, none, or any number of trucks at the bid

price. |
#232 - 1996 Mack RD688S S/N TM028548 o 45,000
#231 - 1996 Mack RD688S S/N TM028547 $ 4€, 000
#131 - 1996 Mack RD688S S/N TM028546 ¥ 45 000
#132 - 1996 Mack RD688S S/N TM028545 4 45 000
#128 - 1995 Mack RDB88S S/N SM024381 $ 42,000
#228 - 1995 Mack RD6B8S S/N SM024380 ¥ 42,000

$§ 34 000

#126 - 1996 Mack RD688S S/N PM016196
93

)3 o 1Y

035 461 0-2



#133 - 1999 International 2574 S/N XH613539 t 42,500

#233 - 1999 International 2574 S/N XH561670 t 42 500

#130 - 1991 Peterbilt 357 S/N MD311192 ¥ 2S00

#230 - 1991 Peterbilt 357 S/N MD311191 ¥ 25e00

#229 - 1991 Peterbilt 357 S/N MD311190 ¥ ageo0

#129 - 1991 Peterbilt 357 S/N MD31 1189 ¥ 25,000

Specify Delivery Date: 5 feci fed on —C»D,\--i-

Model: R 638 % Meelk Qoo | \K_ Mo def
Deséription: : __ﬁ‘f ax le h.m-?

Title Fees: l-\ e lwd ed

Other:

Name of Company: A[aba,,w_, r'u—c,&_ C;'«a,'c/

Mailing Address: Biov Acpet qu?_\ Eluw. ¢ 35203
Telephone: &% ~744. c44o / 35 200,253 4_/F;qx 332.-10¥%
Name: pa ¢l Bush a / Br“ Cu. Grc, ha nq

Title: g”'iff (2 Sele 5 /]/mwulef*

Date: o / /

File: f.'luserslbobbylwinword/eqw‘pbids/rruckoo.doc

14 of 1Y



ern Alabama Peterbilt, a divis " Warrior Tractor & Equipi 0., Inc.
Thirteen (13} new Peterbilt 357 Tri-axle dumptrucks
BID FOR CAB AND CHASSIS TRUCK

TRIAXLE DUMP TRUCK
Bid ltem - ‘ Base Bid .-
Base Bid
Cab and Chassis Truck TriAxle
(Dump Body Included)
Guaranteed Delivery In 90 days or less. __ $83,500.00/each
Base Bid
Cab and Chassis Truck TriAxle
(Dump Body Included)
Guaranteed Delivery In 180 days or less.__same as above
Option #1;
48 Month Purchase Plan
Annual Payment $24,180.21/each  $314,342.76

see attached information
NO BUYBACK OPTION OFFERED
BID FOR USED CAB AND CHASSIS TRUCK

TRIAXLE DUMP TRUCK
Bid item
Trade-In, Individual Bid, or
Guaranteed Auction Consignment Price
Tuscaloosa County reserves to right to sell
all, none, or any number of trucks at the bid
price.
#232 - 1996 Mack RD688S S/N TM028548 NO_BID
#231 - 1996 Mack RD688S S/N TM028547 NO BID
#131 - 1996 Mack RD688S S/N TM028546 NO BID

- #132 - 1996 Mack RD688S S/N TM028545 NO BID
#128 - 1995 Mack RD688S S/N SM024381 NO BID
#228 - 1995 Mack RD688S S/N SM024380 NO BID
#126 - 1995 Mack RD688S S/N PM016196 NO BID
: NERTIL



o 035 4eA

#133 - 1999 International 2574 S/N XH613539 NO BID

#233 - 1999 International 2574 SIN XH561670 NO BID

#130 - 1991 Peterbilt 357 S/N MD311192 : $19,000I.00 Trade-in or_individual bid
#230 - 1991 Peterbilt 357 S/N MD311191 $19,000.00 Trade-in or individual bid
#229 - 1991 Peterbilt 357 S/N MD311190 $19,000.00 Trade-in or_individual bid
#129 - 1991 Peterbilt 357 S/N MD311188 $19,000.00 Trade-in or_individual bid
Specify Delivery Date: __7_to 8 weeks from receipt of order

Model: Peterbilt 357

Description: Tri;axle dumptruck w/ 16' dump bed meeting your specifications

Title Fees: included in bid price

Other: _N/A

Name of Company: _Northern Alabama Peterbilt, a_division of Warrior Tractor &

Mailing Address: P.O. Box 412 Northport, AL 35476
Telephone: (205) 339-0300

Name: Luther W. Richardson 1l or Kit Avery
Title: Sales Representative

Date: October 10, 2000

' File: flusers/bobbyiwinword/equipbids/iruck00.doc

Equipment Co., Inc.



7. J.M. WOOD AUCTION COMPANY, INC. will pay any/all expenses in conducting the
auction, and will furnish a computerized statement of each item sold.

8. J.M. WOOD AUCTION COMPANY, INC. gives Tuscaloosa County a gross financial
guarantee of $483.00 for the sale of the equipment listed on the Tuscaloosa County
Inventory (Exhibit “A”). A commission rate of 7% Absolute will be charged to gross sales
and any other equipment that may be added by Tuscaloosa County after the date of this
agreement and sold by J.M. Wood Auction Company, Inc.

9. JM. WOOD AUCTION COMPANY, INC. will provide, as a service to Tuscaloosa

County, a detailed report on any repairs deemed necessary to make the equipment bring the

maximum dollar. J.M Wood Auction Co., Inc. will furnish an on-site detailed clean-up service.
This clean-up service will be paid by J. M. Wood Auction Co., Inc.

10. J.M. WOOD AUCTION COMPANY, INC. will freight all equipment listed on the
Tuscaloosa County Inventory (Exhibit “A”) to our facility in Montgomery, Alabama.

11. J.M. WOOD AUCTION COMPANY, INC. will issue Tuscaloosa County a check for full
settlement within seven (7) banking days from date of auction,

We would like to thank you for allowing J.M, WOOD AUCTION COMPANY, INC. to
present this proposal to you and we look forward to conducting your auction.

“WE TURN EQUIPMENT INTO CASH!!”

Date

/ P 1/ ll/zooo

d Auction Company, Inc. Representative Date

Tuscaloosa County, Chairman
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BID FOR CAB AND CHASSIS TRUCK
TRIAXLE DUMP TRUCK

Bid ltem

Base Bid

Base Bid
Cab and Chassis Truck TriAxle
(Dump Body Included)

Guaranteed Delivery In 90 days or less. _$76902.00 PER .UNIT

Base Bid
Cab and Chassis Truck TriAxle
(Dump Body Included)

Guaranteed Delivery In 180 days or less, NOT'"APPLICABLE -

Option ##1:
48 Month Purchase Plan

Annual Payment $22,071.45 PER UNIT IN ANNUAL ARREARS

BID FOR USED CAB AND CHASSIS TRUCK
TRIAXLE DUMP TRUCK

Bid Item

W W pase Bid

Trade-In, Individual Bid, or

Guaranteed Auction Consignment Price
Tuscaloosa County reserves to right to sell
all, none, or any number of trucks at the bid
price.

#232 - 1996 Mack RD688S S/N TM028548
#231 - 1996 Mack RD688S S/N TM028547
#131 - 1996 Mack RDG88S S/N TM028546

#132 - 1996 Mack RD688S S/N TM028545
#128 - 1995 Mack RD688S S/N SM024381

#228 - 1995 Mack RD688S S/N SM624380

#126 - 1993 Mack RD688S S/N PM016196

[

$45,000.00

$45,000.00

$45,000.00

$45,000.00

$40,000.00

$40,000.00

' $33,000.00 ![) 33
" - L3 - -
” ]




#133 - 1999 International 2574 S/N XH613539 $47,000.00

#233 - 1999 International 2574 S/N XH561670 $47,000.00
#130 - 1991 Peterbilt 357 S/N MD311192 $25,000.00
#230 - 1991 Peterbilt 357 S/N MD311191 $25,000.00
#229 - 1991 Peterbilt 357 S/N MD311190 $25,000.00
#129 - 1991 Peterbilt 357 S/N MD311189 $25,000.00

Specify Delivery Date: Estimated delivery: 60 days from date ordered

Mode!: International 2574 2001 year model
Description: Ox Bodies dump body 16ft

Title Fees: $16.50 per unit

Other:

Name of Company: Southland International Trucks, Inc.

Mailing Address: 3540 Skyland Blvd. E Tuscaloosa, AL 35405

Telephone: 205-556—4{343 8B00-844-4343
Name: 7]\,‘,\@ ﬂ/d%ﬂ Hunter Lollar
Title: Truck Sales

Date: October 11, 2000

File: fusers/obbyiwinword/equipbids/fruck00.doc

0% 46T - 10-5
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consign the dump trucks to a licensed auctioneer at a guaranteed minimum price. The County
also reserves the right to accept or reject the bids on any individual trucks. Tuscaloosa County
will continue to use these dump trucks until new replacement dump trucks are placed in service.
The used dump trucks will be available for pickup upon delivery of new replacement dump
trucks by the selected dealer. Dump trucks will be made available for pickup in the same
condition they were on the bid date. A bid bond, cashier’s check, bank letter of credit, or other
type security approved by the County Commission shall be required for all dump trucks for
which a bid or auction consignment proposal is submitted. Appointments may be made to
inspect the dump trucks by contacting Mr. Jack Miles, Shop Superintendent at 345-6600.

BUYBACK OFPTION:

Bidders shall submit a guaranteed buyback price at a minimum of 1 year or 40,000 miles
(whichever oceurs first) from the date of delivery to Tuscaloosa County. The vendor selected
shall furnish a performance bond or an executed buyback agreement in the amount of the
buyback price. The County reserves the right to aceept or reject this option based on the best
overall benefit for the County.

Southland International Trucks, Inc. will guarantee a buy-back
bid on the trucks we are bidding, one year or 40,000 miles from
the delivery date of the trucks at a FAIR MARKET VALUE which will
be negotiated twelve months from the delivery date, fThis is
based on an IRS ruling that the selling dealer can NOT

predetermine values on Federal Excise Exempt customer's
trucks.

T o | ,ZO’S



RESOLUTION AND AGREEMENT TO PARTICIPATE IN THE
JOINT BIDDING PROGRAM FOR COUNTIES

WHEREAS, the Alabama Legislature enacted Act No. 2000-153 during the 2000
Regular Session, which act authorizes two or more counties in the state to enter into agreements
for the joint bidding and purchase of items required to be bid under Alabama’s competitive bid
law (Code of Alabama 1975, § 41-16-50 et seq.); and

WHEREAS, the Association of County Commissions of Alabama (hereinafter “the
Association) has agreed to administer a joint bidding program for counties pursuant to Act No.
2000-153 for the joint bidding of certain equipment, materials, and supplies required to be
competitively bid under Alabama's competitive bid law; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to Code of Alabama 1975, § 4[-16-21.1 and § 14-16-50, each
county desiring to participate in this county joint bidding program is required to adopt a similar
resolution, signifying its desire to partlclpate and its agreement to the terms and conditions of
participation; and

WHEREAS, the Tuscaloosa County Commission desires to join and patticipate in the
county joint bidding program and understands and agrees to the procedures as set out below:

(1) That the Association of County Commissions of Alabama, a non-profit organization
devoted to providing support and services to its membership of the 67 counties in Alabama, shall
provide administrative services to the program, and in this regard, shall

* oversee the development of written specifications for each item to be bid,

e provide notice by mall to respective bidders for each item to be jointly bid as required
by law,

* open bids pursuant to bid specifications at its office at 100 North Jackson Street in
Montgomery, Alabama, and

« provide other services as necessary excluding the awarding of the contracts.

(2) That in order to participate, the Tuscaloosa County Commission shall forward to the
Association the names and addresses of each person or company who has submitted a written
request to be included in solicitations of bids for a particular item (its “vendor list™), and that
following receipt of said vendor lists, the Association shall mail appropriate bid specifications to
each applicable person or company if that particular item is being bid, as provided in Code of
Alabama 1975, § 41-16-54.

(3) That in compliance with Code of Alabama 1975, § 41-16-54, the Tuscaloosa County
Commission shall not be eligible to purchase an item under a contract awarded through the

0-4
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program unless it has provided the Association with its vendor list for that item, if such a list is
held by the county.

(4) That the Association will provide the county with a notice of each solicitation for bid
and in compliance with Code of Alabama 1975, § 41-16-54, the Iuscaloosa County
Commission shall post said notice on a bulletin board in the county’s purchasing office.

(5) That in compliance with Code of Alabama 1975, § 41-16-54, the TuscaloosaCounty
Commission agrees that it shall not be eligible to purchase an item under a contract awarded
through the program unless it has posted such notice,

(6) That following the opening of bids, a designated county commission will serve as
awarding authority for the program and shall determine the lowest responsible bidder and award
any contract bid through the program at a regular meeting of the designated county commission
as announced at the opening of bids,

(7) That the Association of County Commissions of Alabama shall not serve as the
awarding authority for any item bid through the program.

(8) That participation in the county joint bidding program is strictly voluntary, and that,
subject to the conditions set out in paragraphs 2, 3, 4, and 5, once a contract has been awarded
for a particular item bid through the program, the Tuscaloosa County Commission may
purchase that item during the contract period under the terms of and at the price established
under the contract, but shall not be required to purchase any particular item under the contract
awarded through the program.

(9) That if the Tuscaloosa County Commission decides to purchase an item other than
through the program, it must separately bid that item if such bidding is required by Alabama's
competitive bid law .

(10) That following the award of a contract under the county joint bidding program,
purchases of items through the program by the Tuscaloosa County Commission shall be
made directly from the successful bidder by the county pursuant to its own purchasing policy,
and that there shall be no joint purchasing agent representing the program or any counties
participating in the program.

(11) That the Tuscaloosa County Commission shall remain a member of the
program so long as it desires and agrees to participate in this joint bidding agreement under its
terms and conditions, and that the Tuscaloosa County Commission shall give at least thirty (30)
days notice to the Association of County Commissions of Alabama of its intent to terminate its
participation in the program.

(12) That at the expiration of the thirty days termination notice, the Tuscaloosa

County Commission shall be removed from the program and from any correspondence or
advertisement regarding the program or any item to be bid under its terms and conditions.

10-4
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(13) That following its termination from the program, the Tuscaloosa. County
Commission shall not be eligible to make purchases under the terms and at the cost of the
contract award for a particular item, and will be required to bid each item on its own under the
requirements of Alabama’s competitive bid law.

(14) That this resolution, once adopted by the Tuscaloosa County Commission, shall
serve as its agreement and contract with all other counties participating in the county joint
bidding program for the joint bidding of certain items required to be bid under Alabama’s
competitive bid law.

(15) That prior to soliciting any bids for items to be jointly bid under the county joint
bidding program, the Association shall forward a list of all participating counties to the Office of
Examiners of Public Accounts.

(16) That in order for a county to purchase an item through the county joint bidding
program, it must have joined the program by adopting this resolution prior to the solicitation of
bids for that item, but that once the county has joined the program, it shall remain a member, and
subject to the conditions set out in paragraphs 2, 3, 4, and 5 above, shall be eligible for the
purchase of all items thereafter bid under the program until and unless it terminates its
participation as set out in paragraphs 11, 12, and 13 above.

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE ZIuscaloosa COUNTY COMMISSION that it
agrees to all terms and conditions of the county joint bidding program as set out above, and
desires to participate in said program.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that it is the intent of the Tuscaloosa County
Commission by adoption of this resolution to enter into a joint bidding agreement with all other
counties participating in the county joint bidding program.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that a copy of this resolution be immediately forwarded
to the Association of County Commissions of Alabama with a request that the Tuscaloosa
County Commission be included in the county joint bidding program for all items bid through
the program until and unless notified of the County’s desire to terminate its participation under
the procedures set out in paragraphs 11, 12, and 13 above.

IN WITNESS THEREOF, the _Tuscaloosa _ County Commission has caused this
Resolution to be executed in its name and on its behalf by its Chairman on this the 11th_day of
October , 2000.

County Commission
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RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING USE OF CREDIT CARDS
IN Tuscalcosa COUNTY

WHEREAS, the Tuscaloosa _ County Commission desires to implement a program
to accept credit cards for payments made to a county office pursuant to the authority granted in
Act No. 2000-154, and once implemented, to allow each office in the county to elect to accept
credit cards as provided in Section 4 of Act No. 2000-154; and

WHEREAS, EFS National Bank has agreed to offer these services to counties in
Alabama pursuant to specific terms and conditions; and

WHEREAS, the _Tuscaloosa County Commission desires to participate in this program
and enter into an agreement with EFS National Bank to provide Tuscaloosa County
Commission credit and debit services as provided in its agreement.

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE Tuscaloosa COUNTY COMMISSION that it hereby
elects to participate in the county credit card program developed by EFS National Bank for
counties in Alabama, and further elects to enter into an agreement with EFS National Bank to

provide these services pursuant to the terms and conditions set out in its August 28, 2000
agreement.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that once the agreement with EFS National Bank is
executed, each ofiice in the county may elect to accept credit cards as provided in Section 4 of
Act No. 2000-154 and pursuant to rules and regulations adopted by the _Tuscaloosa
County Commission as provided in Section 1 of Act No. 2000-154.

IN WITNESS THEREOF, the Tuscaloosa County Commission has caused this

Resolution to be executed in its name and on its behalf by its Chairman on this the 11thday of
October . 2000.
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To: ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT
TUSCALOOSA, ALABAMA

We, the undersigned petitioners of the Lake Retreat arca, desperately need our road
made safe for our children who ride the school bus, for our own vehicle traffic and

the many visitors that use the road known as Mountain View Lane/Cedar Hill Drive.

The road is washed out in places so that two cars cannot pass safcly. The road has been
scrapped down to rock in a lot of places so that when it rains, the soil is washed away and
the large rocks protrude and cause damage to cars. We respectfully ask that our road be
made safe.

Pleasc give our petition your consideration.
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