TUSCALOOSA COUNTY COMMISSION
MEETING
September 18, 2013

TUSCALOOSA COUNTY §
STATE OF ALABAMA §

This being the date and hour to which the Tuscaloosa
County Commission adjourned, the County Commission met pursuant to
such adjournment with Probate Judge W. Hardy McCollum presiding as

Chairman. The following members were present:

Stan Acker
Jerry Tingle
Bobby Miller
Reginald Murray

Commissioner Jerry Tingle moved, seconded by Commissioner

Stan Acker, the County Commission voted unanimously to authorize
payment of invoices for engineering consultant services to
Sentell Engineering, Almon Associates and Burk-Kleinpeter for
the following bridge replacement projects:

0ld Fayette Road $23,000.00

Traweek Road over Binion Creek $4,230.00

Malone Creek Road over Malone Mill Creek $3,700.00

Old Fayette Road over Binion Creek tributary $1,675.00
South Sandy Road over Big Sandy Creek $515.00

Exhibit 9-1, Page

Commissioner Stan Acker moved, seconded by Commissioner
Bobby Miller, the County Commission voted unanimously to accept
the recommendation by the County Engineer to award the annual

bid for Crushed Stone, that was opened on August 14, 2013, as
follows:

CRUSHED STONE
Martin Marietta Materials, Inc.

Exhibit 9-2, Page

Commissioner Bobby Miller moved, seconded by Commissioner
Jerry Tingle, the County Commission voted unanimously to adopt
resolutions approving and accepting the following preliminary

plat submissions:

Maggi Subdivision
Robert Crum Mobile Home Park
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Resurvey of Lots 58 and 59 Stone Harbour, Second
Section

Forest Oak Lane Subdivision

Exhibit 9-3, Page

Commissioner Bobby Miller moved, seconded by Commissioner
Jerry Tingle, the County Commission voted unanimously to
authorize a subdivision regulation waiver request, (pertaining to

setbacks), for the following subdivision:
Fields Crossing Phase ITII

Exhibit 9-4, Page

Commissioner Bobby Miller moved, seconded by Commissioner
Jerry Tingle, the County Commission voted unanimously to
authorize a subdivision regulation waiver request, (pertaining

to the installation of metal pPipe in lieu of concrete pipe), for

the following subdivision:

Mimosa Gardens

Exhibit 9-5, Page

Commissioner Bobby Miller moved, seconded by Commissioner
Jerry Tingle, the County Commission voted unanimously to approve
a request for extension of a performance bond, (of one year) ,

for Mimosa Gardens.

Exhibit 9-6, Page

The County Commission voted unanimously to approve the
warrants issued to cover Tuscaloosa County’s expenditures for
August 2013.

Exhibit 9-7, Page

Commissioner Bobby Miller moved, seconded by Commissioner
Reginald Murray, the County Commission voted unanimously to pass

a continuing resolution to adopt the FY2012-2013 budget as the
FY2013-2014 budget at this time.

Commissioner Reginald Murray moved, seconded by
Commissioner Stan Acker, the County Commission voted unanimously

to award the bid for transmission service and oil changes with




Page 3

filter and related products to Speedy 0il Change, the lowest
bidder meeting specifications and requirements. The bids were

opened September 11, 2013.

Exhibit 9-8, Page

Commissioner Stan Acker moved, seconded by Commissioner
Bobby Miller, the County Commission voted unanimously to
authorize an amendment to 1 funding allocation previously
approved, of $12,805.00, to the Echola Volunteer Fire Department
for site preparation of a safe room. Due to the lowest bidder
for this project including some “in kind donation”, the actual
cost of the site preparation will only be $8,100.00. The
amendment is to allow Echola Volunteer Fire Department to use
the excess funds for building costs other than just site

preparation.

Commissioner Bobby Miller moved, seconded by Commissioner
Reginald Murray, the County Commission voted unanimously to
depart from the order of business set forth in the official

agenda to discuss a subdivision issue.

Commissioner Bobby Miller made a motion, seconded by
Commissioner Reginald Murray, to accept Torri Park Subdivision
for maintenance by the Tuscaloosa County Commission. After
discussion, the motion was amended to accept the streets for
minimal maintenance pending further legal action by the County

Attorney. The motion to amend passed unanimously.

Commissioner Jerry Tingle moved, seconded by Commissioner
Reginald Murray, the County Commission voted unanimously to go
into Executive Session prior to the end of this meeting to

discuss Board Appointments.

Commissioner Jerry Tingle moved, seconded by Commissioner
Reginald Murray, the County Commission voted unanimously to
reappoint Sherie Giles to the Tuscaloosa County Library Board.

The term will expire November 1, 2017.
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There being no further business to come before the
Tuscaloosa County Commission, the meeting adjourned to

Wednesday, October 2, 2013.
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Sentell Engineering, Inc.

Sentell Engineering Inc

P O Box 1246
Tuscaloosa, AL 35403

(205)752-5564
ssentell@sentell.net

Tuscaloosa County Commission

c/o Katherine Cross :
2810 35th Street |
i Tuscaloosa, AL 35401

Activity

| * Services to Date:

* Design Services (50% Complete)

 * Surveying Services (100% Complete)
'« Less Previous Payments

'
h

Accounts Not Paid in Full are Subject to a Finance Charge of 1.5%/Month or 18%

[* RE: Old Fayette ROad Bridge Project (Barbee Creek) Project No. TCP-63-12-12

Date Invoice No.
| 09/10/2013 ! 12-194-2
Terms Due Date

LDueon receipt ' 09/10/2013

S R e 1

! 23,000.00
7,700.00
-7,700.00

— e e R e __A

Total[ $23,000.00!

RECEIVED
SEP 11 2013

TUSCALOOSA COUNTY
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
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PO Drawer 2729
Tuscaloosa, AL 35403
205-349-2100

Tuscaloosa County Department of Public Works Invoice number 00004

2810 35th St. Date 08/31/2013
Tuscaloosa, AL 35401

Project 2012309 TUSCALOOSA COUNTY
TRAWEEK ROAD BRIDGE OVER BINION

CREEK REPLACEMENT
For Professional Services provided through August 31, 2013
invoice Summary -
Contract Prior Total Current
Description Amount Billed Billed Billed
Survey :
Deign Topographic Survey 4,200.00 4,200.00 4,200.00 0.00
Property Survey, TractSketches and Legal Descriptions 2,850.00 285.00 285.00 0.00
Subtotal 7,050.00 4,485.00 4,485.00 0.00
Structural
Bridge Structural Design 37,000.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Transportation
Roadway Geometry and Approach Plans 17,800.00 5,340.00 9,670.00 4,230.00
Categorical Exclusion Preparation Services 3,500.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Utility Coordination Services 1,900.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Geotechnical Engineering 18,400.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Additional Geotech, If 3 span brige Is required 3,700.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Subtotal 45,300.00 5,340.00 9,570.00 4,230.00
Total 89,350.00 9,825.00 14,055.00 4,230.00
RECEIVED
SEP 13 2013
oS AGRRS DEPARTIENT
Tuscaloosa County Department of Public Works Invoice number 00004 Invoice date 08/31/2013
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as sociates

PO Drawer 2729
Tuscaloosa, AL 35403
205-349-2100

Tuscaloosa County Department of Public Works Invoice number 00004

2810 35th St. Date 08/31/2013
Tuscaloosa, AL 35401

Project 2012131 TUSCALOOSA COUNTY
MALONE CREEK ROAD BRIDGE OVER

MALONE MILL CREEK
For Professional Services provided through August 31, 2013
Invoice Summary
Contract Prior Total Current
Description Amount Bilted Billed Billed
Survey
Deign Topographic Survey 5,200.00 5,200.00 5,200.00 0.00
Property Survey, Tract Sketches and Legal Descriptions 2,850.00 285.00 285.00 . 0.00
Additional Topographic Survey, if roadway realignmant is 1,850.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
required i
Subtotal 9,900.00 5,485.00 5,485.00 0.00
Structural
Bridge Structural Design 37,000.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Transportation
Roadway Geometry and Approach Plans 18,500.00 5,660.00 9,250.00 3,700.00
Categorical Exclusion Preparation Services 3,500.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Utility Coordination Services 1,200.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Geotechnical Engineering 21,300.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Additional Geotech, if 3 span brige is required 3,700.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Subtotal 48,200.00 5,550.00 9,250.00 3,700.00
Total 95,100.00 11,035.00 14,735.00 3,700.00
RECEIVED
SEP 11 2013
TUSCALOOSA COUNTY
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
Tuscaloosa County Department of Public Works Invoice number 00004 Invoice date 08/31/2013
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BURK-KLEINPETER, INC.

ENGINEERS. ARCHITECTS, PLANNERS, ENVIRONMENTAL SCIENTISTS

CHAIRMAN OF THE BOARD

PRESIDEN
WM. R, “BIFF" BURK. 111. PE 600 LURLEEN WALLACE BLVD, SUITE 180 SIDENT
. . GFEORGE C. KLEINPETER, JR., PE
TUSCALOOSA, AL 35401-9166
ASSOCIATES TELEPHONE (205) 759-3221 FAX (205) 759-9166

REGIONAL VICE PRESIDENT - AL
DAVID 5. HARGROVE, PE WWW . BKIUSA.COM O. JEFFREY WOOD, PE
CRAIG P, WILLIAMS, PE

\
m VICE PRESIDENT !
WILLIAM R. BURK, JR., 1912-1986 BRUCE L. HIGGINBOTHAM, PE

OVER 100 YEARS OF SERVICE

August 31, 2013

Bobby Hagler

Tuscaloosa County Engineer !
2810 35th Street *
Tuscaloosa, AL 35401

RE: Binion Creek Tributary Bridge Replacement
Client Number 252
Invoice #10
BKI Job No. Tu.12.018-01
For professional services rendered on the referenced project through the month of August 2013.

PAYMENT REQUEST NO. 10 ' |

TOTAL % AMOUNT CURRENT
AMOUNT COMPLETE COMPLETE AMOUNT DUE

DESIGN SERVICES $19,500.00 96% S 18,650.00 S -
SURVEY SERVICES $5,500.00 100% $  5,500.00 S -
PROPERTY PLATS $2,500.00 80% S 2,250.00 S -
GEOTECHNICAL SERVICES $ 17,999.00 65% S 11,675.00 $ 1,675.00
$45,499.00 S 38,075.00 $ 1,675.00
PREVIOUSLY INVOICED: S (36,400.00)
AMOUNT DUE: $ 1,675.00
RECEIVED
SEP 12 2013
BKI INVOICE:53341 TUSCALOOSA COUNTY
ks PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMEN]
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[ARLIN
\
é
20
! %"
o,
BATON ROUGE * NEW ORLEANS ¢ SHREVEPORT ¢ MOBILE ‘\"’! TUSCALQOOSA « BIRMINGHAM + OCEAN SPRINGS * JACKSON
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CHAIRMAN OF THE BOARD

WM. R, “BIFF"” BURK, |, PE

ASSOCIATES

DAVID S. HARGROVE, PE
CRAIG P, WILLIAMS, PE

WILLIAM R, BURK, JR., 1912-1986

Bobby Hagler

Tuscaloosa County Engineer
2810 35th Street
Tuscaloosa, AL 35401

BURK-KLEINPETER, INC.

ENGINEERS, ARCHITECTS, PLANNERS, ENVIRONMENTAL SCIENTISTS

600 LURLEEN WALLACE BLVD, SUITE 180
TUSCALOOSA, AL 35401-9166
TELEPHONE (205) 759-3221 FAX (205) 759-9166
WWW.BKIUSA.COM

OVER 100 YEARS OF SERVICE

August 31, 2013

PRESIDENT
GEORGE C. KLEINPETER, JR., PE

REGIONAL VICE PRESIDENT - AL
O. JEFFREY WOOD, PE

VICE PRESIDENT
BRUCE L. HIGGINBOTHAM, PE

RE: South Sandy Bridge Replacement

Client Number 252
Invoice #16

BKI Job No. Tu.12.010-01

For professional services rendered on the referenced project through the month of August 2013.

PAYMENT REQUEST NO.16

DESIGN SERVICES
SURVEY SERVICES
PROPERTY PLATS
GEOTECHNICAL SERVICES

SUPPLEMENTAL AGREEMENT

DESIGN SERVICES
GEOTECHNICAL SERVICES
SURVEY SERVICES

BKI INVOICE: 53340

BATON ROUGE ¢ NEW ORLEANS -

TOTAL % AMOUNT CURRENT
AMOUNT COMPLETE COMPLETE  AMOUNT DUE
$65,000.00 99% $ 64,363.80 $ -
$7,500.00 100% S 7,500.00 $ -
$2,500.00 91% $  2,265.00 $  515.00
$ 23,750.00 100% $ 23,750.00 $ -
$98,750.00 $ 97,879.24 $  515.00
$51,750.00 99% $ 51,450.00 $ -
$7,500.00 100% $  7,500.00 $ -
$5,500.00 100% $  5,500.00 $ -
$ 64,450.00 $ -

PREVIOUSLY INVOICED: S (161,814.24)
AMOUNT DUE: S 515.00

e
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SHREVEPORT + MOBILE

il TUSCALQOSA * BIRMINGHAM *
~

RECEIVED
SEP 12 2013

TUSCALOOSA COUNTY
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT

OCEAN SPRINGS + JACKSON




Tuscaloosa County Bid Data Sheet

BID NUMBER: 20130719011 CATEGORY: CRUSHED STONE

BID DATE: 7/19/2013 DATE .SPECIFICATIONS RECEIVED: 7/19/2013

BID ITEM(S): purchase of Crushed Stone for the period from October 1, 2013 through September 30, 2014
Bid authorized by County Commission: YES X NO Date Authorized: 7/19/2013

Commission Book Page: Vendors Allowed 26 days
From 7/19/2013 to 8/14/2013

Specifications compiled by: County Engineer Bobby Hagler (205) 345-6600
Problems with specifications  YES NO X

if yes, explain:

Number of bidders notified: 6 Number that responded. 4
Bid opened in public meeting: YES X NO
If no, explain:

Bid awarded to: Martin Marietta Aggregates
Bid Amount: Varies by product. See folder for details.

Date awarded: 9/18/2013 To low bidder: YES X . NO
Commission Book: Page:
If not awarded to low bidder, was 3% applied? YES NO

if no, explain:
Bid rejected:  YES NO

If yes, explain:

Comments, problems and/or recommendations: Bids were opened by Chairman W. Hardy McCollum during the
Commission Meeting on 8-14-13

Bidders responding to bid invitation:

Martin Marietta Aggregates

S. T. Bunn Construction Co.
Southeast Materials Corporation
Vuican Materials Co.

September 18, 2013
1:13:54PM




Crushed Stone Bid Tabulation

[ owne ]

FY2013-14
Vendor Vulcan Materiais
Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price i il ]
ttem Quantity | Zone1 | Bid Amount (Defivered) |  Quanfity Zone2 | Bid Amount (Dekivered) | Quantity | Zone 3 | Bid Amount (Defvered) Quantity Pick up Price Bid Amount
AL #1 - #610 (washed) 4150( 5 16251$ 67,437.50 2100/ § 17508 36,750.00 2100/ s 185015 38,850.00 630) $ 1200 | 8 7,560.00
AL #7 - #10 (washed) 10500/ § 1625 s 170,625.00 520005 1750 | S 91.000.00 520005 1850 |% 96,200.00 1560] $ 1200 % 18,720.00
AL #1 - #610 21000/ § 1375 1S 288,750.00 10500{$  15.00 | § 157,500.00 | 10500 § 16.00 | § 168,000.00 3150{ $ 250 s 23,925.00
AL #7 - #10 (unwashed) 15500{$ 1525 (s 236,375.00 105001 1650 | S 17325000 | 10500] S 17.50 1§ 182,750.00 3150( $ 10008 34,650.00
Ciass 1 Rip rap 550{s 20005 11,000.00 550{5 2125 |$ 11,687.50 5500 22513 12,237 50 165 $ 1500 2,475.00
Ciass 2 Rip rap 5200|s 20003 104,000.00 2600]5 2125 |$ 55,250.00 2600{s  2225|$ 57,850.00 780] ¢ 15.00 |8 11,700.00
Crusher Run 3/4 31000/ §  13.751S 426,250.00 15500{$ 1500 | § 23250000 | 15500[$  16.00 1S 248,000.00 4650} § 250 [ $ 44,175.00
Crusher Run 1 112 550)$  13.751$ 7,562.50 550] $ 15,00 | $ £,250.00 550] § 16.00 | § §,800.00 550} s 850 [ 5,225.00
Crushed aggregate base. T 6200{$  13751s 85,250.00 3100)s  1500)S 46.500.00 3100/8 1600 S 49,600.00 945| 3 8503 8,977.50
TOTALS $ 1.397,250.00 $ 812,687.50 $ 863,287.50 $  163,407.50
Vendor $.7. Bunn Construction Co.
Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price . ) N
item Quantity | Zone1 | Bid Amount (Delivered) |  Quantity Zone2 | Bid Amount (Deivered) | Quantity | Zone3 | Bid Amount (Delvered) Quantity Pick up Price Bid Amount
AL #i - #610 (washed) 4150]  No Bid 2100]  No Bid 2100|  No Bid 630 No Bid
AL #7 - #10 (washed) 10500]  No Bid 5200]  No Bid 5200 No Bid 1560 No Bid
AL #1 - #610 (unwashed) 21000] $1460 !s 306,600.00 10500] § 1625 | S 17062500 | 10500 § 1860 | 195,300.00 3150 $11.00] s 34,650.00
AL #7 - #10 (unwashed) 15500) 51460 | 226,300.00 10500 § 162513 17062500 | 10500| § 1860 1S 195,300,00 3150 $11.00]$ 34,650.00
Class 1 Rip rap 550| $17.60 !s 9,680.00 550/ § 1925 |$ 10,587.50 550§ 218018 11,880.00 165 $13.50] s 2.227.50
Class 2 Rip rap 5200 si760 |s 91,520.00 26000 s 1825 |s 50,050.00 26000 s 21601$ 56,160.00 780 513.50] $ 10,530.00
Crusher Run 3/4 31000] 1260 s 390.600.00 15500 § 1425 |8 22087500 | 15500/ § 1660 | S 257,300.00 4650| s 500 |3 41,850.00
Crusher Run 1 172 550{ 1260 |§ 6.930.00 550/ § 1425 |s 7.837.50 550| § 1660 1§ 9,130.00 550} 3 500 2,950.00
Crushed aggregate base. Tyf  6200] 51260 |s 78,120.00 3100{ s 142508 44,175.00 3100( s 1e60]s 51 460.00 945 s 900 | $ £,505.00
TOTALS $ 1.109.750.00 $ 674,775.00 $ 776,530.00 $  137,362.50
Vendor Martin Marietta Materiais
Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price .
tem Quantty | Zome1 | Bid Amount (Deivered) |  Quantity Zone2 | Bid Amount (Delivered) | Quantity | Zone 3 | Bid Amount (Defivered) Quantity Pick up Price Bid Amount
AL #1 - #6510 (washed) 4150 $15.00( § 62,250.00 2100 1625| § 34,125.00 2100 16.75! § 35,175.00 630 $11.00} ¢ £,930.00
AL #7 - #10 (washed) 10500 $15.00} § 157,500.00 5200 16.25! § 84.500.00 5200 16.75] S 87,100.00 1560 $11.00] g 17,160.00
AL #1 - #610 (unwashed) 210001 5 1450 | § 304,500.00 10500[s 1575 ]S 165.375.00 | 10500]§ 1675 8 175,875.00 3150] s 1050 | $ 33,075.00
AL #7 - #10 (unwashed) 1550013 1450 |s 224,750.00 10500($ 1575 |$ 16537500 | 10500]$ 1675 s 175,875.00 3150} 3 1050 | $ 33,075.00
Ciass 1 Rip rap 550{S 1825 |$ 10.587.50 s50/s 2075 |8 11.412.50 550/ 8 2125 |s 11,687.50 165] % 1400 {$ 2.310.00
Class 2 Rip rap 5200/ 19251$ 100,100.00 2600/ 2075 |$ 53,950.00 2600]s 2125 (s 55,250.00 780} § 1400 |3 10,520.00
Crusher Run 34 31000/ § 1350 § 418,500.00 15500)$ 1475 |$ 22862500 | 15500{5 1550 | 240,250.00 4650] $ 950 |$ 44,175.00
Crusher Run 1 172 550{$ 1350 | S 7,425.00 s50|s 1475 ]S 811250 ss0/8 1550 s 8.525.00 550] s 950 13 5,225.00
Crushed aggregate base Ty} 6200/$  13.50{$ 83,700.00 3100{S 1475 45,725.00 3100] § 1550 | 8 48,050.00 945) ¢ ss0|s 8,977.50
TOTALS $  1,369,312.50 $ 797,200.00 S 837,787.50 $  161,847.50
Vendor Southiand Resources
Gnit Brice Urit Price Unit Price )
ttem Quantity | 2one1 | Bid Amount (Delivered) | Quantity Zone2 | Bid Amount (Defivered) | Quantty |  2one3 | Bid Amount (Defivered) Quantity Pick up Price Bid Amount
AL #1 - #610 (washed) 4150 No Bid 2100 No Bid 2100 No Bid 630 No Bid
AL #7 - #10 (washed) 10500 No Bid 5200 No Bid 5200 No Bid 1560 No Bid
AL #1 - #6510 (unwashed) 21000| § 1600 | § 336,000.00 10500 No Bid 10500 No Bid 3150| s 8501 $ 26,775.00
AL &7 - #10 (unwashed) 15500/ 16.001s 248,000.00 10500 No Bid 10500 No Bid 3150 ¢ 8503 26,775.00
Ciass 1 Rip rap 5500 18.501S 10.725.00 550 No Bid 550 No Bid 165} s 12003 1,980.00
Class 2 Rip rap 5200)$ 1950 | § 101,400.00 2600 No Bid 2600 No Bid 780} § 1200 s 5,360.00
Crusher Run 3/4 31000{$ 1600 |$ 496,000.00 15500 No Bid 15500 No Bid 4550] $ 850 0$ 39,525.00
Crusher Run 1 172 550)$ 1550 % 8.525.00 550 No Bid 550 No Bid 550] ¢ 500 | $ 4,400.00
Crushed agoregate base Tyl 6200/§ 1550 {$ 96,100.00 3100 No Bid 3100 No Bid 945| 3 500 ls 7,560.00
TOTALS $  1,296,750.00 S 116,375.00




STATE OF ALABAMA §

TUSCALOOSA COUNTY §

RESOLUTION ACCEPTING PRELIMINARY PLAT

MAGGI SUBDIVISION

WHEREAS, the County Engineer has reported to the Tuscaloosa County
Commission that the developer has complied with all Tuscaloosa County
Subdivision related to the preparation and presentation of a preliminary plat for a
new development or the cxtension of an existing development; and

WHEREAS, the Tuscaloosa County Commission has been presented with
the preliminary plat and accompanying information, and determines that there 1s no
just reason to withhold approval of the preliminary plat.

NOW, THEREFORE, IT BE RESOLVED BY THE TUSCALOOSA
COUNTY COMMISSION that the preliminary plat recommended for approval
by the Tuscaloosa County Engineer is approved and accepted

Approved and accepted at our regularly scheduled meeting on this the 18" day of
September, 2013

Tuscaloosd County Commission

“Melvin L. Vines
County Administrator



STATE OF ALABAMA §

TUSCALOOSA COUNTY §

RESOLUTION ACCEPTING PRELIMINARY PLAT

ROBERT CRUM MOBILE HOME PARK

WHEREAS, the County ngineer has reported to the Tuscaloosa County
Commission that the developer has complied with all Tuscaloosa County
Subdivision related to the preparation and presentation of a preliminary plat for a
new development or the extension of an existing development; and

WHEREAS, the Tuscaloosa County Commission has been presented with
the preliminary plat and accompanying information, and determines that there is no
just reason to withhold approval of the preliminary plat.

NOW, THEREFORE, IT BE RESOLVED BY THE TUSCALOOSA
COUNTY COMMISSION that the preliminary plat recommended for approval
by the Tuscaloosa County Engineer is approved and accepted

Approved and accepted at our regularly scheduled meeting on this the 18" day of
September, 2013

Tuscalooss ounty Commission

Mel;in L. Vines )

County Administrator




STATE OF ALABAMA §

TUSCALOOSA COUNTY §

RESOLUTION ACCEPTING PRELIMINARY PLAT

RESURVEY OF LOTS 58 AND 59
STONE HARBOUR SECOND SECTION

WHEREAS, the County Engineer has reported to the Tuscaloosa County
Commission that the developer has complied with all Tuscaloosa County
Subdivision related to the preparation and presentation of a preliminary plat for a
new development or the extension of an existing development; and

WHEREAS, the Tuscaloosa County Commission has been presented with
the preliminary plat and accompanying information, and determines that there 1s no
just reason to withhold approval of the preliminary plat.

NOW, THEREFORE, IT BE RESOLVED BY THE TUSCALOOSA
COUNTY COMMISSION that the preliminary plat recommended for approval
by the Tuscaloosa County Engineer is approved and accepted

Approved and accepted at our regularly scheduled meeting on this the 18" day of
September, 2013

Melfin L. Vines

County Administrator



STATE OF ALABAMA §
TUSCALOOSA COUNTY §

RESOLUTION ACCEPTING PRELIMINARY PLAT

FOREST OAK LANE

WHEREAS, the County Engineer has reported to the Tuscaloosa County
Commission that the developer has complied with all Tuscaloosa County
Subdivision related to the preparation and presentation of a preliminary plat for a
new development or the extension of an existing development; and

WHEREAS, the Tuscaloosa County Commission has been presented with
the preliminary plat and accompanying information, and determines that there 1s no
just reason to withhold approval of the preliminary plat.

NOW, THEREFORE, I'T BE RESOLVED BY THE TUSCALOOSA
COUNTY COMMISSION that the preliminary plat recommended for approval
by the Tuscaloosa County Engineer is approved and accepted

Approved and accepted at our regularly scheduled meeting on this the 18" day of
Septemb670 13

uscaloosa Qounty Commission

“Mcin L. VinEﬁM““"'"'

County Administrator




Bobby C. Hagler
County Engineer

Commission District:

Subdivision:
Owner:
Engineer / Surveyor:

Wavier Requested:

Comments:

TUSCALOOSA COUNTY PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT

2810 35th Street
Tuscaloosa, Alabama 35401
(205) 345-6600
FAX (205) 345-6600

Allan D. Springer, Sr.
Assistant County Engineer

Subdivision Wavier Request
Tuscaloosa County Commission
September 18, 2013

3

Field’s Crossing, Phase Iil

Omar, LLC

Almon Associates / Jack McGuire

Mr. McGuire requests that the minimum setback lines be waivered. He is

proposing a 15 foot setback adjacent to the front of the property and no side or
rear setback lines.

The master plan for this subdivision was approved by the City of Tuscaloosa in October 2005.

The 2013 Subdivision Regulations state the following:

5-4-24 Minimum Setback Lines

The minimum interior building setbacks lines shall be defined as the following:

e 30 feet along and adjacent to the front property line of the lot (abutting the

street).

e 135 feet along and adjacent to the rear property line.
e 10 feet along and adjacent to both sides of the property line on each side (20
feet total).

Easements may be located within the minimum building setback lines.




o m——— Almon Associates, Inc.

y P.O. Drawer 2729
a mon Tuscaloosa, AL 35403

associates 2008 121h Strest
Tuscaloosa, Al. 35401

phone: 205.349.2100

fax: 205.349.2107
September 17, 2013 web: www.almonassociaies.com

Tuscaloosa County Public Works Dept.

2810 35" st.

Tuscaloosa, AL 35401

Attn: Katherine Cross, PE

Re: Fields Crossing

Dear Kathrine;

The Master Plan for the above 90 ac. development was approved by the City of Tuscaloosa
Planning and Zoning Department in October of 2005. At that time Tuscaloosa County did not
have in place requirements for subdivisions within the Police Jurisdiction as it currently does
since April of 2013.

Therefore, we respectfully request that a waiver be granted by the Tuscaloosa County

Commission, to allow for a minimum building line of 15 feet on the front of each of the lots in
the current plat of Fields Crossing Phase lll.

Should you need anything further in this matter please advlse, and thank you for your
assistance.

Sincerely,

;an)(/ W%Z«:J

Jack H. McGuire, Ir. PE/PLS

cc: OMAR, LLC
File:

Cfi3FieldsCrossingCountyWaiver

CIVIL ENGINEERING
SITT DESION » ENVIBONMENTAL » STRUGTURAL DESIGH « SURVEYING « MAPPING - TRANSPORTATION « WATHR ESOURGES




TUSCALOOSA COUNTY PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
2810 35th Street
Tuscaloosa, Alabama 35401
(205) 345-6600
FAX (205) 345-6600

Allan D. Springer, Sr.
Assistant County Engineer

Bobby C. Hagler
County Engineer

Subdivision Wavier Request
Tuscaloosa County Commission
September 18, 2013

Commission District: 3

Owner: Bill Trick, Robert W. Burchalter, Jimmy Burns

Engineer / Surveyor:  McGuire and Associates

Wavier Requested: The owner requests a variance from the Tuscaloosa County Subdivision
Regulations’ requirement that all drainage pipes must be Class II Reinforced
Concrete Pipe.

Comments:

At the time that the final plat was approved, Mimosa Gardens was in the planning jurisdiction of the City
of Tuscaloosa.

The 2013 Subdivision Regulations state the following:

5-4-13 STREET DRAINAGE FEATURES

Inlets

d. Concrete shall be in accordance with AASHTO current specifications. All side drain
pipes shall be Class 11l Reinforced Concrete Pipe with a minimum size of 15 inches. All
roadways cross drain pipes shall be Class 11l Reinforced Concrete Pipe with a minimum
size of 18 inches. All joints shall be mortared per AASHTO current specifications.




BUCHALTER REAL ESTATE TEXAS, LLC
361 Summit Boulevard, Suite 110
Birmingham, AL 35243

September 10, 2013

Mr. Bobby Hagler, County Engineer
Tuscaloosa County Public Works Department
2810 35" Street

Tuscaloosa, AL 35401

Re: Mimosa Gardens Subdivision

Dear Mr. Hagler,

We are requesting that the Tuscaloosa County Public Works Department waive the County
requirements and accept the aluminum drainage structure at the Mimosa Gardens Subdivision. At the

time of the subdivision’s construction, the City of Tuscaloosa required, approved and signed off on the
drainage system design.

We ask that the County accept the pipe as it is installed per those guidelines.
Thank you for your consideration,

Buchalter Real Estate Texas, LLC

By: Steven E. Camp, its CFg

CC: Robert W. Buchaiter
William F. Trick




TUSCALOOSA COUNTY PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
2810 35th Street
Tuscaloosa, Alabama 35401
(205) 345-6600
FAX (205) 345-6600

Allan D. Springer, Sr.

Assistant County Engineer

Bobby C. Hagler

County Engineer

Subdivision Bond Extension Request
Tuscaloosa County Commission
September 18, 2013

Commission District: 3

Owner: Bill Trick, Robert W. Burchalter, Jimmy Burns

Engineer / Surveyor: ~ McGuire and Associales

Comments: The developers of Mimosa Gardens are requesting that the Tuscaloosa County

Commission extend the perforinance bond for one year. A bond was received
September 10, 2013.



BUCHALTER REAL ESTATE TEXAS, LLC
361 Summit Boulevard, Suite 110
Birmingham, AL 35243

September 10, 2013
Mr. Bobby Hagler, County Engineer
Tuscaloosa County Public Works Department

2810 35" Street
Tuscaloosa, AL 35401

Re: Mimosa Gardens Subdivision

Dear Mr. Hagler,

The owners of the Mimosa Gardens Subdivision, Buchalter Real Estate Texas, LLC, are requesting that
the performance bond be extended for 1 year for Mimosa Gardens subdivision to September 9, 2014,

Repairs noted in the August 28, 2013 letter to the owner and engineers, with the exception of the
sidewalks and aluminum pipe, will be completed within 30 days. We will notify you as soon as they are

completed.
Thank you for your consideration,

Buchalter Real Estate Texas, LLC

\ e €

By: Steven E. Camp, its CfO

CC; Robert W. Buchalter
William F. Trick



B1203204

PERFORMANCE BOND

STATE OF ALABAMA  }
TUSCALOOSA COUNTY }

KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS, That we, Puchaiter Real Estate Texas. Lic

(hereinafter .
called the “Developer”) of P mingham, Ab as principle and
The Cincinnati Insurance company N (herelnafter called the “Surety”), as suréty, do

hereby auknowledge ourselves indebted and ﬁrmly bound and held unto Tuscaloosa County,

Alabama (hereafter called the “County™), a government organization, in the penal sum of Thirty-one
thousand and no/100-=- g the nayment of which well and truly to be made in lawful money of the

United States, we do hereby bind ourselves, our successors and assigns and personal

representatives, jointly and severally, firmly by these presents.

BUT THE CONDITION OF THE FOREGOING OBLIGATION OR BOND IS THIS:

WHEREAS, the Developer is developing certain lands within the jurisdiction of the County
Commission of Tuscaloosa County as a subdivision; and

WHEREAS, on  September 3 ,2013 _the Developer presented to the
Tuscaloosa County Department of Planning and Community Development and the Tuscaloosa
County Engineer for approval, a final plat of the subdivision known as _Mimosa Gardens
, generally located in Tuscaloosa, AL , such
approval being required prior to recording such plat in the Probate Office of Tuscaloosa County,
Alabama; and

WHEREAS, it is desired to place the County in an assured position of having these
improvements made and utilities installed according to the specifications of the County of
Tuscaloosa and without cost to the County.

NOW, THEREFORE, if the Developer shall complete the construction and installation in
the said subdivision (according to the specifications for such works as prescribed by the County) of
the following streets, water lines and/or other drainage structures, to wit:

Traffic control/Sidewalks/Curb repair/Detention Pond/Fence Repair/Seeding/Mulch
Mimosa Gardens, Tuscaloosa, AL

Within a period of 305 days from the date of completion of this instrument or
within such extension of time as may be granted by the County Commission of Tuscaloosa and
endorsed hereon in writing, this obligation or bond shall be null and void, otherwise it shall remain
in full force and effect.

44



IN WITNESS WHERFEOQF, the Developer has executed or caused the within bond to be
executed, and said surety has executed the same or caused same to be executed by its duly

authorized officersonthe  °tP  day of _September ,201°
SURETY FOR BONI) @zr Rea{l Egtate Texas, LLC
Principal -7
The Cincinnati Insurance Company \S"'QV"\’ E C/"" r Cro
R T 4
P. 0. Box 145496 , - 36l Summit Blvel, Stetlo
Cimritmatt,; Oh1o 35250 o .
Bumishom, AL 37243
‘ [74
Suret
The Cincippati Insurapee Company

ol

W. Geof@¥ ott - Attorney-In-Fact

45




THE CINCINNATI INSURANCE COMPANY
Fairfield, Ohio
POWER OF ATTORNEY

KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS: That THE CINCINNATI INSURANCE COMPANY, a corporation organized under the laws of
the State of Ohio, and having its principal office in the City of Fairfield, Ohio, does hereby constitute and appoint

Robert W. Poellnitz, Jr.; Walter Wayne Guy; Rick Manasco;
Carrie Hickman; Robert G. Plott and/or W. Geoffrey Plott

of Tuscaloosa, Alabama its true and lawful Attomey(s)-in-Fact to sign, execute, seal
and deliver on its behalf as Surety, and as its act and deed, any and all bonds, policies, undertakings, or other like instruments, as follows:
Any such obllgatlons in the United States, up to
Twenty Five Million and No/100 Dollars ($25,000,000.00).
This appointment is made under and by authority of the following resolution passed by the Board of Directors of said Company
at a meeting held in the principal office of the Company, a quorum being present and voting, on the 6" day of December, 1958, which
resolution is still in effect:

“RESOLVED, that the President or any Vice President be hereby authorized, and empowered to appoint Attorneys-in-
Fact of the Company to execute any and all bonds, policies, undertakings, or other like instruments on behalf of the
Corporation, and may authorize any officer or any such Attomey-in-Fact to affix the corporate seal; and may with or
without cause modify or revoke any such appointment or authority. Any such writings so executed by such Attorneys-in-
Fact shall be binding upon the Company as if they had been duly executed and acknowledged by the regularly elected
officers of the Company.”

This Power -of Attorney is signed and sealed by facsimile under and by the authority of the following Resolution adopted by the
Board of Directors of the Company at a meeting duly called and held on the 7* day of December, 1973.

“RESOLVED, that the signature of the President or a Vice President and the seal of the Company may be affixed by
facsimile on any power of attorney granted, and the signature of the Secretary or Assistant Secretary and the seal of the
Company may be affixed by facsimile to any certificate of any such power and any such power of certificate bearing
such facsimile signature and seal shall be valid and binding on the Company. Any such power so executed and sealed
and certified by certificate so executed and sealed shall, with respect to any bond or undertaking to which it is attached,
continue to be valid and binding on the Company.”

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, THE CINCINNATI INSURANCE COMPANY has caused these presents to be sealed with its corporate
seal, duly attested by its Vice President this 10" day of May, 2012.

THE CINCINNATT INSURANCE COMPANY

S, A Jg\;:ic:(

Vice President

STATE OF OHIO ) ss:
COUNTY OF BUTLER )

On this 10" day of May, 2012, before ine came the above-named Vice President of THE CINCINNATI INSURANCE COMPANY,
to me personally known to be the officer described herein, and acknowledged that the seal affixed to the preceding instrument is the corporate
seal of said Company and the corporafe seal and the signature of the officer were duly affixed and subscribed to said instrument by the

authority and direction of said corporation.
o “||I""""

\‘yg\ A &ﬁ,,'

"'
O
* /I r-
N s
")
A
t\“‘"&

2 ;
X3
-
05 MARK J. HKLLER Attorney at Law
~ ¥ NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF GHIO

%,

My commission has no expiration
date. Section 147.03 O.R.C.

I, the undersigned Secretary or Assistant Secretary of THE CINCINNATI INSURANCE COMPANY, hereby certify that the above
is a true and correct copy of the Original Power of Attorney issued by said Company, and do hereby further certify that the said Power of
Attorney is still in full force and effect.

GIVEN under my hand and seal of said Company at Fairfield, Ohio.

9th day of September L2013 /{ /z

Assistant Secretary

BN-1005 (5/12)



MONTH OF:

001

112
116
117
120
160
710

720
730
750
780
781
783
783
784
785
786
787

CHECKED BY:

APPROVED BY TUSCALOOSA COUNTY COMMISSION:

AUGUST, 2013
FUND
GENERAL FUND

SPECIAL SALES TAX
ROAD & BRIDGE

CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT

RRR GAS TAX
REAPPRAISAL
COMMUNITY DEVELOP
PAYROLL-CHECKS

PAYROLL-DIR DEP
EXCESS LAND SALES
FIDUCIARY

PISTOL PERMIT

E911

GAS TAX BONDING
WORKMEN'S COMP
HEALTH INSURANCE
TAX COLL SPECIAL
TAX ASSR SPECIAL
MFG HOMES

MOTOR VEH TRAINING

CHECK NUMBERS

17888-18303
37-38
5247-5425

2177-2204

93332-93383
56234-56367
16835-17739
382

7953-7972
4868-4878

121
1

Ay

AMOUNT

$4,711,031.69
$2,500,000.00
$3,253,711.36

$404,181.59

$1,304,406.78
$114,997.94
$1,103,436.14
$152.66

$36,189.32
$33,951.21

$10,897.55
$275,000.00

WILLIAM M. LAMB, ACCOUNTING MANAGER

CHAIRMAN, W. HARDY MCCOLLUM

COMMISSIONER, STAN ACKER

COMMISSIONER, JERRY TINGLE

COMMISSIONER, BOBBY MILLER

$13,747,956.24

0%4%\

VM/\/ //z/:/b

@M/ 297 bl

COMMISSIONER, REGINALD MURm P AA G



Tuscaloosa County Bid Data Sheet

BID NUMBER: 20130822001 CATEGORY: OIL CHANGES
BID DATE: 8/22/2013 DATE SPECIFICATIONS REGEIVED; 8/22/2013

BID ITEM(S): purchase of transmission service with filter, inclusive of related products and service; and oil
changes with filter, inclusive of related products and service

Bid authorized by County Commission. YES X NO Date Authorized: 8/22/2013
Commission Book Page: Vendors Aliowed 20 days

From 8/22/2013 to 9/11/2013

Specifications compiled by: Tuscaloosa County Sheriff's Office Lt. Andy Norris (205) 752-0616
Problems with specifications  YES NO X

If yes, explain:

Number of bidders notified: 16 Number that responded. 7
Bid opened in public meeting: YES NO X

If no, explain: Bids were opened in the office of the County Administrator. Those present: Melvin Vines, Bill Lamb,
Chief Byron Waid, Patricia Miller and Erica Seale with AAMCO Transmission.

Bid awarded to:

Bid Amount: .

Date awarded: To low bidder. YES NO
Commission Book: Page:

If not awarded to low bidder, was 3% applied?  YES NO

if no, explain:
Bid rejected:  YES NO

If yes, explain:

Comments, problems and/or recommendations: AAMCO Transmission bid was mailed certified, attempted on
(Saturday, 9-7-13, 10:55 a.m.), courthouse was closed, bid was not received. Erica Seale with AAMCO was
present for bid opening and asked if bid could be faxed. This was approved by Bill Lamb. Bid received via fax.
Rick"s Quality Transmission and AAMCO Transmission did not bid on oil changes.

Bidders responding to bid invitation:

AAMCO Transmission Service

Express Oil Change & Service Center (1)
Express Oil Change & Service Center (2)
Rick"s Quality Transmission

Speedy Oil Change (1)

Spiffy"s Car Wash

Townsend Ford inc.

September 11, 2013
3:41:34PM



Bid Sheet

Tranemission Service
(Inclusive of relared producrs and service)

One or Mors

Firm or Businiess Quoting: /])ﬁuw e 7;621’? S SSitn s 7-(:5@5&/005 A
aagress SO\ e Crc\aed BleAE  Tyscaloese 4 3sv0s
Contact Person: ’R:Q-K SeGs Cu

Phone Number:_ A 05 550 - 84 || [

Fax Number;___ OG- 5§56 — 843

~
A
(0¥ -,ag:,@g@;ﬂ@m
Authorized Signatire
‘ |
ale] 12

Date

Sg/c8 39v¥d OOWWY 2811228582 PGB £182/11/68



GB/c0

Requesr for proposal !
Transmission Service W/Filiar

Inclusive of related produsts and servics
Bids must be received prior to 9:00 Ald on Septemaer 13, 2013 |

One o7 More Vehicies 'w{rx\o G2 A \; C, (%

\ G5 5
Specification for bid: ('V aenVie B0
S0 s 13y 18
. &
Trapsmission Service W/Filter using S 250 & {5497

fluid and filter which meets or exceeds the manufaciures specificetions
for said vehicle.

Bid must include service delivery in Tuscalooza Counny, Alabams

The Tuscaloosa Co. Sheriff s Office currently hes Chevrolst Tahoe's, Ford Crowr Vicioria's, and Ford F-
150 and F-350 trucks.

Firm or Business '

I

A\uﬁcm@\mﬂ & c;&btu !“‘\u \w\o@ S y\\LSS;or.S
Fﬁqvl“;'_ LOO C&\“,

[

Page i ¢

Fovd 0} i ZB11228808C pG:i86 €18Z/11/60



Requeat for proposal

Oil Changes W/Filter
Inclusive of related products and service
Bids must be received prior to 9:00am September 11, 2013

One or More Vehicles

Specification for bid;

Of Change
Up 10 6 guarts of name brand motor o) which

meets or exceeds the manufactures specifications
for said vehicle.

Additional Ol per quart for vehicles requiring more than $
six quarts,

Qil Change

Up to § guarts of name brand synthetic blend motor oil which

mests o7 exceeds the manufactures gpecifications

for said vehicle. 3

Additional Qil per quart for vehicles requiring synthetic biend
more than six quasts.

The following is included with

Check Anti-Freeze Coolant

Check and Fill washer fluid levels

Check Battery and terminal connections

Check and Fill Brake Fluid

Check and Fill Power Steering Fluid

Check and Fill Transmission Fluid

Check and Fill Differential

Check and notate if Air Filter needs replacement
Check and notate if belts and hoses need to be replaced

- L 4 . R J

* @ @ ¢ 3

Bid must include service delivery in Tuscalooss County, Alabama

Currently the Sheriffs Office has over 125 vehicles currently in its fleet

AAN o pNo  BAD

Firm or Business

Page 1 of 3
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AAMCO

USPS.com® - Track & Confirm

English Custormer Sarvioo Usk5 Mobile
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AAMCO Transmission bid was mailed certifiedy,

10:55 a.m. Courthouse was closed, bid was
AAMCO was present for bid opening and aske
was approved by Bill Lamb. Bid received v

sifocks usps. somig o/T rackConfirmAction! inpm.acﬁon’?tLabeis=70132250000033970610

attempted on Saturday, 9:7-13
not received. Erica Seale with

d if bid could be faxed. This
ia fax.
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Firm or Business Quoting:

Address:

Bid Sheet

Transmission Service
(Inclusive of related products and service)

One or More

Express 01l Change

604 |57 StreckFach-

Contact Person:

Tohn Carnest / Brian Sanders

Phone Number:;

(zvs) 323587

Fax Number:

(205) 424-0400

Authoriz T
SR € 20]D

Page 2 of 3




Request for proposal

Transmission Service W/Filter
Inclusive of related products and service
Bids must be received prior to 9:00 AM on September 11, 2013

One or More Vehicles

Specification for bid;

Transmission Service W/Filter using hY 4 56? =

fluid and filter which meets or exceeds the manufactures specifications
for said vehicle.

Bid must include service delivery in Tuscaloosa County, Alabama

The Tuscaloosa Co. Sheriff's Office currently

has Chevrolet Tahoe’s, Ford Crown V ictoria’s, and Ford F-
150 and F-350 trucks.

Exprzss Ol Change, =15 Srect-

Firm or Business

Page 1 of 3




Firm or Business Quoting;

Address:

Bid Sheet

0il Changes
{Unclusive of related products and service)

One or More

Express 0. Change

609 [S5M Shreet-Eact

Contact Person:

Josca Joesa AL 3544/

Phone Number;

BrianSsnders | Tohn Caymu\ [205> 3423557

Fax Number:

(205 424- o400

Authorize ig;xTatur
Symeat b 2013
D

Page 2 of 3




Request for proposal

Oil Changes W/Filier
Inclusive of related products and service
Bids must be received prior to 9:00am September 11, 2013

One or More Vehicles

Specification for bid,;

Oil Change b 27 q 5

Up to 6 guarts of name brand motor oil which
meets or exceeds the manufactures specifications
for said vehicle.

Additional Oil per quart for vehicles requiring more than b 3 7

six quarts,

Oil Change
Up to 6 guarts of name brand synthetic blend motor oil which

meets or exceeds the manufactures specifications 4q 9 5
for said vehicle, :

L5

Additional Oil per quart for vehicles requiring synthetic blend 7. 5 O
more than six quarts.

Guaranteed to be completed in thirty minutes or less

The following is included with the above:

¢  Check Anti-Freeze Coolant

»  Check and Fill washer fluid levels

Check Battery and terminal connections

Check and Fill Brake Fluid

Check and Fill Power Steering Fluid

Check and Fill Transmission Fluid

Check and Fill Differential

*  Check and notate if Air Filter needs replacement

*  Check and notate if belts and hoses need to be replaced

Bid must include service delivery in Tuscaloosa County, Alabama

Currently the Sheriffs Office has over 125 vehicles currently in its fleet

Express 0il Change - 5% Sprect

Firm or Business

Page 1 of 3




Bid Sheet

Transmission Service
(Inclusive of related products and service)

One or More

Firm or Business Quoting: £ XPRESS &/L CNAN(GE

Aadress_(p 823 Hwy (9 SpuTH Y- 238 Kice ik Ad. Mg
Contact Person__/N IKE TYHnNSg

Phone Number__ A0S 33 0403

Fax Number__ 205 343 F0(

Authorized S{énature

§-27-13

Date

Page 2 of 3



Reguest for proposal

Transmission Service W/Filter
Inclusive of related products and service
Bids must be received prior to 9:00 AM on September 11, 2013

One or More Vehicles

Specification for bid;

Transmission Service W/Filter using $ g 7 9 q
fluid and filter which meets or exceeds the manufactures specifications
for said vehicle,

Bid must include service delivery in Tuscaloosa County, Alabama

The Tuscaloosa Co. Sheriff's Office currently has Chevrolet Tahoe’s, Ford Crown Victoria's, and Ford F-
150 and F-350 trucks.

EXPRESS 010 CHANGE 6322 My 1§ SouTH N~ Rice mINE KD, N.E.

Firm or Business

Page 1 0of3



Bid Sheet

0Oil Changes
(Inclusive of related products and service)

One or More

Firm or Business Quoting; g(ﬂke’f 5 9/ é CMN & £

Address._ 322 Hwy (9 SouTH Y 238 Rice Mive RD. N.E.
Contact Persomn: m IKE Jﬂ/v'/\/fﬂf‘/
Phone Number: lﬂg 3 17[_5 0 ‘/0 _3

Fax Number: 2—05' 3 43 0 3 0 /

Fhith, Ophrarr—

Authorized Signatl%

f~27- /3

Date

Page 2 of 3



Request {or proposal
Oil Changes W/Filter
Inclusive of related products and service
Bids must be received prior to 9:00am September 11, 2013

One or More Vehicles

Specification for bid;

Oil Change
Up to 6 guarts of name brand motor oil which

meets or exceeds the manufactures specifications
for said vehicle,

Additional Oil per quart for vehicles requiring more than
six guarts.

Qil Change

Up to 6 guarts of name brand synthetic blend motor oil which
meets or exceeds the manufactures specifications

for said vehicle.

Additional Oil per quart for vehicles requiring synthetic blend
more than six quarts.

Guaranteed 10 be completed in thirty minutes or less

The following is included with the above:

*  Check Anti-Freeze Coolant

Check and Fill washer fluid levels

Check Battery and terminal connections

Check and Fill Brake Fluid

Check and Fill Power Steering Fluid

Check and Fill Transmission Fluid

*  (Check and Fill Differential

¢ Check and notate if Air Filter needs replacement

*  Check and notate if belts and hoses need to be replaced
Bid must include service delivery in Tuscaloosa County, Alabama

Currently the Sheriffs Office has over 125 vehicles currently in its fieet

s34 99

Jg.oo

‘ §.00

EXPRESS 01l CHANGE (311 Hwy 69 SouTH v 23§ Piee mww RN Ne

Firm or Business

Page 1 of 3



Bid Sheet

Transmission Service
(Unclusive of related products and service)

One or More

Firm or Business Quoting: [/ c A3 Quality TRLOWSM 155005

Address_ 356 | [rreen shoro  Ave.  Tiscolosa AL 35401
Contact Person; RIQ[{ TA;//OK

Phone Number: R0 & -39 (- OIS
Fax Number: ;{07 i 56” rOé75’

Il 7

Authorized Si gnaturg

Q- /- 15

\

Date

Page 2 of 3




Request for proposal
Transmission Service W/Filter

Inclusive of related products and service
Bids must be received prior to 9:00 AM on September 11, 2013

One or More Vehicles

Specification for bid;

Trapsmission Service W/Filter using 5 99.00 -¢ 110 0O
fiuid and filter which meets or exceeds the manufactures specifications
for said vehicle.

Bid must include service delivery in Tuscaloosa County, Alabama

The Tuscaloosa Co. Sheriff’s Office currently has Chevrolet Tahoe’s, Ford Crown Victoria's, and Ford F-
150 and F-350 trucks.

/Zic/j Qua//'fy Tlowt i (55/0¢5

Firmn or Business

Page 1 of 3



Bid Sheet

Transmission Service
(Inclusive of related products and service)

One or More

Firm or Business Quoting; E)Deﬁdh’ o ‘ (i’](,ma(’, Iﬂc,

Address: 5qoo # \2 NO""’% bYODK DY‘I\\/JC

Contact Person: LO s H‘LLbbaV(,‘

Phone Number: 20 5 - 330 - OQD ﬂr

Fax Number: 205- 530'070‘

W

Authorigéd Signature

7/5//5

Date

Page 2 of 3



Request for proposal

Transmission Service W/Filter
Inclusive of related products and service
Bids must be received prior to 9:00 AM on September 11, 2013

Omne or More Vehicles

Specification for bid;

Transmission Service W/Filter using $_ ¢ gee M (l(ah'ecl

fluid and filter which meets or exceeds the manufactures specifications
for said vehicle.

Bid must include service delivery in Tuscaloosa County, Alabama

The Tuscaloosa Co. Sheriff's Office currently has Chevrolet Tahoe’s, Ford Crown Victoria's, and Ford F-
150 and F-350 trucks.

Speedy 01l Chun%c  Inc.

Firm or Busindss !

Page 1 of 3



SPEEDY OIL CHANGE, INC.

TRANSMISSION SERVICE:

VEHICLE TAHOE CROWNVIC  F-150 F-150 F-350 EXP

TYPE: SHORT PAN _LONG PAN

FLUID DEXTRON MERCON5 MERCONS5 MERCON5 LVFLUID MERCONS

TYPE: Vi OR OR OR OR
LVFLUID __ LVFLUID _ LV FLUID LV FLUID

TOTALCOST: 57.19 41.90 41.90 63.71 75.79 63.71




Bid Sheet

Oil Changes
(Unclusive of related products and service)

One or More

Firm or Business Quoting: SO{’(’A \/ O ; l (‘ l'){AD(,\(’ , I’K -

J | ’
Address: quo *LZ \\[Cl#hbféi)ﬁ dﬂ\fa

Contact Person: LO\'iCL H’uh b[}.rd

Phone Number: ZD 5 - 5 30 —'0 q O é"

Fax Number: 206" 53(\)‘ qul

A

Authorized Pj#nature

Date
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Request for proposal

Oil Changes W/Filter
Inclusive of related products and service

Bids must be received prior to 9:00am September 11, 2013

One or More Vehicles

Specification for bid;

Qil Change $ ee al h]! l;gg‘,_l

Up to 6 guerts of name brand motor il which
meets or exceeds the manufactures specifications
for said vehicle.
W

Additiopal Oil per quart for vehicles requiring more than $
Six quarts.

H

Oil Change
Up to 6 guarts of name brand synthetic biend motor oil which

meets or exceeds the manufactures specifications M
for said vehicle.

(

Additiona} Oil per quart for vehicles requiring synthetic blend W
more than six quarts, b

tH

Guaranteed 10 be completed in thirty minutes or less

The following is included with the above:

¢ Check Anti-Freeze Coolant

*  Check and Fill washer fluid levels

¢ Check Battery and terminal connections

¢ Check and Fili Brake Fluid

o Check and Fill Power Steering Fluid

e  Check and Fill Transmission Fluid

¢ Check and Fill Differential

»  Check and notate if Air Filter needs replacement

¢  Check and notate if belts and hoses need to be replaced

Bid must include service delivery in Tuscaloosa County, Alabama

Currently the Sheriffs Office has over 125 vehicles currently in its fleet

Speedy 01 Change | Inc.

Firm or Budiness I
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OIL CHANGE:

VEHICLE
TYPE:

OiL
REQUIRED:

VEHICLE
CAPACITY:
TOTAL COST:

EXTRA OIL
QUART:

SPEEDY OIL CHANGE, INC.

TAHOE CROWNVIC  F-150 F-150 F-350 EXP
DEXOS 5-20 5-20 5-20 5-20 5-20
CONV. CONV. CONV. CONV. CONV.
bqt. 6at. bat. 74at. 15qt. 7qt.
44.86 37.31 37.31 40.56 71.76 40.56
5.29 3.74 3.74 3.74 3.74 3.74

(NOT REQUIRED FOR ABOVE PRICING)



Bid Sheet

Transmission Service
(Inclusive of related products and service)

One or More

Firm or Business Quoting: > ?\FF\’I‘ s Car Weas\y

Address:_ 42200 'Mgﬂda«e‘ Bvd £ Tusealpes e, AL 33405

Contact Person:_ Don.e ! McCy Ly

Phone Number:(\ZO S) 34s5-9274

Fax Number: (Z205) 34S- 0159y

““Kuthortzesls

ignature

9 Seph, 2cid
Date
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Request for proposal
Transmission Service W/Filter
Inclusive of related products and service
Bids must be received prior to 9:00 AM on September 11, 2013

One or More Vehicles

Specification for bid;

Transmission Service W/Filter using 5.8 9. 7
fluid and filter which meets or exceeds the manufactures specifications
for said vehicle.

Bid must include service delivery in Tuscaloosa County, Alabama

The Tuscaloosa Co. Sheriff’s Office currently has Chevrolet Tahoe’s, Ford Crown Victoria’s, and Ford F-
150 and F-350 trucks.

Spibfy's Gl wWash

Firm or Business

Page 1 of 3



Bid Sheet

0il Changes
(Inclusive of related products and service)

One or More

Firm or Business Quoting; %Q\\Qg%w Cal _ (MNas\
Address:_ 4320 MC_GFC*(\QNA 6\\)::& T Tu%cc\\ooxc\f AL 3546 S

Contact Person:_Dariee N\ McColWloen

Phone Number: (ZOS\ 3435=-94274

Fax Number:  ( 265\ 34S5-C\S9

Authorized Signature

Date

Page 2 of 3




Request for proposal
Oil Changes W/Filter
Inclusive of related products and service

Bids must be received prior to 9:00am September 11, 2013

One or More Vehicles

Specification for bid;

Oil Change Moot (lean $ 29 99

Up to 6 guarts of name brand motor oil which

meets or exceeds the manufactures specifications
for said vehicle.

Additional Oil per quart for vehicles requiring more than b ﬂ 3.5¢
six quarts.

0il Change
Up to 6 guarts of name brand synthetic blend motor oil which
meets or exceeds the manufactures specifications Mo\ Supel

for said vehicle. 5\( Abheby 3 Lﬁ L\ .qe7

Additional Qil per quart for vehicles requiring synthetic biend o0
more than six quarts, $ ﬁ S.

Guaranteed to be completed in thirty minutes or less

The following is included with the above:

Check Anti-Freeze Coolant

Check and Fill ' washer fluid lgvels

Check Battery and terminal connections

Check and Fill Brake Fiuid

Check and Fili Power Steering Fiuid

Check and Fill Transmission Fluid

Check and Fill Differential

Check and notate if Air Filter needs replacement
Check and notate if belts and hoses need to be replaced

¢ @ o e o ¢

Bid must include service delivery in Tuscaloosa County, Alabama

Currently the Sheriffs Office has over 125 vehicles currently in its fleet

SP\‘:’:?\I‘\X Cat  Wash

. A .
Firm or Business
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Bid Sheet

Transmission Service
(Inclusive of related products and service)

One or More

—— ~
Firm or Business Quoting:__ 21/ nd 3 }D/IO I/UC,

address 3800 )€ Fankwa SO E 35UosT

Contact Person: If”) S '%ﬁ/?/‘t" )

Phone Number: ZK)§\ 73—9 - O L’/O}

Fax Number: ZO5> S?J l - [ ﬁ

f%@%

Au‘fh()?ifn@(glr Si gnature
[z% / 13

Date
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Request for proposal

Transmission Service W/Filter
Inclusive of related products and service
Bids must be received prior to 9:00 AM on September 11, 2013

One or More Vehicles
Specification for bid;
09
Transmission Service W/Filter using $ .Q Oq

fluid and filter which meets or exceeds the manufactures specifications
for said vehicle.

Bid must include service delivery in Tuscaloosa County, Alabama

The Tuscaloosa Co. Sheriff's Office currently has Chevrolet Tahoe’s, Ford Crown Victoria’s, and Ford F-
150 and F-350 trucks.

75&//1)5@\)0 onn  Tuc.

Firm or Business

Page 1 of 3



Bid Sheet

Oil Changes
(Inclusive of related products and service)

One or More

Firm or Business Quoting: %ufusf,\m /5/ Y Z\/ C

paaress K 712 fAx JAvD /j)JO - 35405~
Contact Person: //7;‘/[ J '}'Aﬂ)fﬁ

Phone Number:_o20S_ ) Ny3-0S/0/

Fax Number: cj &) Sv) 5/-{7 ) ~ / S)’q

N

Authgrifzed ggnatur

5)28/13

Date
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Request for proposal

Oil Changes W/Filter
Inclusive of related products and service
Bids must be received prior to 9:00am September 11, 2013
One or More Vehicles

Spec@ﬁcation for bid;

&3

Qil Change 3 l . ;—T

Up to 6 guarts of name brand motor oil which
meets or exceeds the manufactures specifications
for said vehicle.

Additional Qil per quart for vehicles requiring more than 3 . 7 )
six quarts.

QOil Change

Up to 6 guarts of name brand synthetic blend motor oil which
meets or exceeds the manufactures specifications
for said vehicle.

$ 31.23
Additiona! Qil per quart for vehicles requiring synthetic blend 3 g
more than six quarts. $ ! 7 )

Guaranieed to be completed in thirty minutes or less

The following is included with the above:

«  Check Anti-Freeze Coolant

»  Check and Fill washer fluid levels

» Check Batiery and terminal connections

Check and Fill Brake Fluid

Check and Fill Power Steering Fluid

Check and Fill Transmission Fluid

Check and Fill Differential

Check and notate if Air Filter needs replacement

Check and notate if belts and hoses need to be replaced

o e ® @

Bid must include service delivery in Tuscaloosa County, Alabama

Currfn/t)l the Sheriffs Office has over 125 vehicles currently in its fleet

JOwwigwn  Foro T

Firm or Business
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